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 BUYING 
 Cars, Trucks and SUV’s

   605-202-0899

 Patricia Curry: 605-661-2860
 Archie Dunham: 605-366-4625

 Virtual Tours
 Elk Point, SD

 Also see us at
 Siouxlandhomes.com

 111 Green Court Drive 
 Links Addition, Elk Point - $220,000

 1706 Arnold Palmer – $214,900

 www.dunhamcompany.com

 2097 sq.ft., 4 BR, 3 
 full bath, new coun -
 tertops, appliances 
 stay. Main floor laun -

 dry. Open concept, fireplace, slider to deck. 
 Master BR w/walk-in closet and bath w/jet tub. 
 Lower level finish w/wet bar, 2 bedroom plus fin -
 ished walk-in storage.

 2,724 Sq Ft ranch, 
 3BR, 3 bath, 4th 
 bedroom w/o 
 egress. Huge mas -

 602 S. Pickney – $207,900
 4 BR, 3 baths, 2216 
 sq. ft. finished. Open 
 concept, fireplace, 
 appliances stay. 

 Master BR with 3/4 bath & walk-in closet plus a 
 double closet. Main floor laundry. Over sized 2 
 stall. Lawn irrigation system, fresh paint. Will sell 
 furniture. Close to school! 

 611 S. Pickney - $294,900
 3,926 sq. ft., 
 4 bedroom, 4 bath 
 crown molding, 
 deck, fireplace, 
 main floor laundry, 

 master bath w/master walk-in closet, porch and 
 underground sprinklers. Move in ready!

 ter w/bath and walk-in closet. Open concept, liv -
 ing room w/ fireplace, dining w/ garden door to 
 covered patio. New lower level finish; beautiful 
 family and game room. Loads of storage.

www.forkfl y.com

Forkfl y Download ForkFly on your smart 
phone or fi nd us at forkfl y.com from 

your phone’s browser. No smart 
phone? No problem. Visit us online to 

print your favorite coupons.

Live Local. Spend Less.
We’re forking out the deals at Forkfl y!

The Bluffs Golf Course
clubhouse, located nearby.
Roads leading to the
neighborhood also were
blocked. 

At 10:20 a.m. Dec. 25,
the subject stopped
communicating with
negotiators. Perimeter
officers heard a gunshot
and saw that a round had
exited through the rear
window of the home.
Officers used tactical
resources to approach the
residence, assess his
condition and reestablish
communication.

At 1:30 p.m., he was
found dead in the
residence.

The Vermillion Police
Department, Clay County
Sheriff ’s Office and DCI
continue to investigate the
incident.
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By Parker Knox
Sportswriter

By no means was it
artistic, but the result was
satisfying nevertheless as
Vermillion's girls
improved to 3-2 with a 37-
31 victory at Tea Area
Friday night. 

A long scoreless spell in
the second period and a 6-
0 Titan run near halftime
left Vermillion facing a 17-
16 halftime deficit in the
low-scoring contest.
Fortunately for the
Tanagers, the winless Tea

Area team was struggling
offensively as well. 

In the second half the
Vermillion defense
increased its intensity and
level of play, too, as the
team held its game-long
turnover total to a mere
eight errors.  A field goal
by Josie Huber, who
shared game-high scoring
honors at 15 points apiece
with older sister
Mackenzie, midway
through the third period
gave VHS a 20-19 lead
after which the Tanagers
never trailed.

The 7-3 third quarter,
after which Vermillion led
23-20, was followed by a
14-point Tanager surge in
the final stanza.  A field
goal by Mackenzie Huber,
a seven-point burst by
Josie Huber and a Blair
Gilkyson bucket gave the
Tanagers some breathing
room at 34-27, their
biggest lead of the night.

Three of four from the
free-throw line by
Mackenzie Huber in the
last 30 seconds kept Tea
Area at bay and preserved
the win.  The Tanagers

sank nine of 13 attempts
from the stripe in the
game, a major factor in a
contest in which field goals
were so difficult to come
by.

Besides the 30-point
total by the Huber sisters,
Gilkyson, who played
extensive minutes for the
first time since returning
from an injury, had three
points, Courtney Johnson
two and Brooke
Schwasinger two.  Crystal
Zitterich led Tea Area with
10 points.

The Tanager girls

missed their head coach,
Nick Mayer, at Tea Area as
he stayed home due to
illness.  Assistant coach J.J.
Heyden handled the head
coaching duties.

The VHS girls hosted
Sioux Falls Christian last
night (Thursday) and are
back home tonight as part
of a girls-boys
doubleheader against
Parkston.  The girls
resume conference play at
Madison Tuesday and at
home next Thursday
against Lennox.

Tanager girls defeat Tea Area 37-31 

Led by medalist
Courtney Trapp, the
Milbank Bulldogs claimed
top honors at the Winter
Wonderland gymnastics
meet on Saturday at the
Vermillion High School
gym.

Milbank finished at
127.2, beating out
Chamberlain (124.85) and
Wagner (119.85) in the 10-
team event. Host
Vermillion finished
seventh at 117.4.

Trapp posted an all-
around score of 36.2, also
claiming top honors on the
floor exercise (9.3), balance
beam (9.2) and uneven
parallel bars (9.1).
Chamberlain’s Vanzi

Knippling won the vault
with an 8.9.

Wagner’s Hannah
Fleming finished fourth in
the all-around with a
32.15.

TEAM SCORES:
Milbank 127.2,
Chamberlain 124.85,
Wagner 119.85, Sisseton
119.2, Stanley County
119.2, Sioux Falls
Washington 118.2,
Vermillion 117.4, Britton-
Hecla 116.65, West Central
111.3, Wall-Kadoka 108.45

Milbank takes Winter
Wonderland; Wagner third

 Many More To Choose From! Check Out www.vermillionford.com

 101 West Cherry Street, Vermillion, SD
 605-624-8624 • 800-624-6690

 www.vermillionford.com
 DONNY STEWART

 202-0424
 DAN VAN OSDEL

 661-1320
 TOM TAGGART

 670-8682

 2011 Ford F-150 Super Crew King Ranch 6 1/2 box, 23,400 miles, one owner, we sold new
 2011 Ford F-150 Super Crew King Ranch, 38,300 miles, one owner, we sold new
 2011 Ford F-150 Super Crew Lariat, 51,000 miles, one owner, we sold new
 2011 Ford F-150 Super Crew Lariat, 39,500 miles, one owner, we sold new
 2010 Ford F-150 Super Crew Lariat, 51,000 miles, one owner, we sold new
 2010 Ford F-150 Super Crew XLT, 30,400 miles, one owner, we sold new
 2009 Ford F-150 Super Crew Lariat, 53,000 miles, one owner, local trade
 2009 GMC Sierra 2500 HD Crew Cab, diesel, 53,000 miles, two owner, local trade
 2008 GMC Sierra 1500 Ext. Cab, 49,800 miles, one owner, local trade
 2008 Ford F-350 Crew Cab Lariat, diesel, 112,000 miles, two owner, we sold new.
 2007 Ford F-350 Crew Cab Lariat, diesel, dually, 49,000 miles, one owner, we sold new
 2007 Ford F-250 Super Cab XLT, long box, diesel, 148,000 miles, one owner, we sold new
 2007 GMC Sierra 2500 HD Crew Cab diesel, one owner, local trade
 2006 Ford F-250 Super Crew Lariat, 98,000 miles, two owner, we sold new
 2005 Ford F-250 Crew Cab Lariat, 166,000 miles, local trade
 2004 Ford F-250 Reg. Cab XLT, diesel, 138,000 miles, one owner, local trade
 2004 Ford F-250 Crew Cab Lariat, diesel, 118,000 miles, two owner, we sold new

FAX US 
YOUR AD 

& SEE THE
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Use your FAX machine to send 
us your Classified ad. 

Remember to include your name & ad.
Prepayment is required when placing classified.

We accept Visa or Mastercard.

Classified FAX number:
605-624-2696
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