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Holt
Transportation, Inc.

is looking for 

DEPENDABLE
OWNERS/

OPERATORS
Must be 23 yrs. of age 

with a good driving record.  

NEW PAY 
SCALE

CDL Required.

SIGN ON 
& SAFETY 

BONUS
Call 877-626-4658

 Ability Building Services in currently taking applications for 
 full-time and part-time positions . ABS provides Services 
 and Support to people with Developmental Disabilities. 
 Current opening include positions working with people 
 within a residential setting.

 Full Time Residential Home Manager (DSPS)
  M-F, 2-10pm  $12.50/hr + benefits

 Full Time Direct Support Professional 
 M-F, 2-10pm  $10.00/hr + benefits

 Full Time DSP Weekends  $10.00/hr + benefits
 Part Time DSP Weekends  $10.00/hr 

 Part Time DSP Awake Overnights  $10.00/hr 

 Full-time positions offer a competitive wage,  along with a 
 generous benefit package which includes:
       • Health Insurance  • Dental Insurance
       • Life Insurance  • 401k
       • Paid Holidays  • Vacation (3 weeks) after 1 year
       • Sick Leave  • Training opportunities available

 Interested applicants can pick-up an application at 
 Ability Building Services (909 W. 23rd St., Yankton) 
 or the One-Stop Career Center 

 PUT YOUR HEART IN IT

 Mead
 Lumber
 Delivery Driver

 Fast growing supplier of building materials is 
 looking for a delivery driver.  Will handle a wide 
 variety of tasks related to local delivery, loading, 
 forklift operation and customer service.  Must be 
 able to perform physical work and have a clean 
 driving record.  Class A or B CDL preferred but 
 not required.

 We offer a competitive starting wage with growth 
 opportunity and a complete benefits package.

 Mead Lumber
 Apply in person at:

 113 W. Main • Vermillion, SD 57069
 Equal Opportunity Employer-Drug Free Workplace

 Resident Assistant Position(s)
 at Cedar Village

 Openings for part-time (3 shifts/wk) and or full-time 
 (5 shifts/wk) positions.  Both positions are overnight shifts 
 from 11:30 pm to 7:30 am.  Positions are benefited with 
 health insurance, vacation, 401K, etc.

 Overnight duties predominantly include cooking, laundry, 
 and kitchen cleaning but will include some personal care, 
 medication assistance, housekeeping, recreation, and 
 socialization.  Previous psychiatric experience beneficial 
 but not required.  Please send your application to or 
 contact CV at:

 Cedar Village Assisted Living
 3111 Shirley Bridge Avenue • Yankton, SD 57078

 Attn: Betty or Julie at 605-665-3401

 Bloomfield, NE
 Yankton, SD
 605-665-4181  We’re an equal opportunity employer

 •Vacation •Holiday Pay •401K 
 •Health, life, dental and vision insurance 
 •Long term/short term disability insurance 
 •Monthly incentive opportunities 
 •Pay range $10-$12 per hour 
 •Variety of flexible shifts 

 Join Our Winning Team! 
 Customer Care Representatives  Needed For Inbound Calls

 We offer:

 “I have been commuting from Hartington, NE and working for First 
 National since 1999. The monthly and quarterly incentives have definitely 
 offset my costs for commuting! Everyone here is helpful and thoughtful 
 and I have made many great friends through the years.  The bank offers a 
 great benefit package including health, dental and vision insurance along 
 with an unbeatable 401K package.” 
 Barb Becker

 “After retiring from the Air Force, I was looking for a 
 new career.  Since I traveled a lot in my past 

 position, I enjoy having the opportunity to talk and help customers all over 
 the United States. In just two years, I have been able to increase my job 
 responsibilities which has provided me with even more variety in my work 
 day. If you enjoy helping and meeting others, this is a great place to 
 work.” 

 “The knowledgeable staff at First National are like 
 nothing I have ever experienced before. Much like 
 working with parents and students in my years as 
 a school teacher, educating customers on financial solutions is a very 
 rewarding experience. The opportunities are endless with incentive 
 payouts, career advancements and a variety of work shifts to choose 
 from.”
 Diana Hicks

 “I came over to First National from another call center and I was amazed 
 at the amount of growth First National is experiencing.  This really gave 
 me a sense of job security.  As a working mother it is great to have an 
 employer I can rely on for benefits and flexibility.” 

 Amy Mulloy

 Apply online today at
 www.firstnational.com

 Denver Dodge

 Plains Marketing L.P. is currently looking to fill the position 
 of LPG Scheduler based in our Yankton, SD office.

 LPG Scheduler – Yankton, SD

 Responsibilities: 
 •  Schedule the movement of LPG 

 shipments at various facilities 
 throughout the US and Canada

 •  Develop and maintain client 
 relationships at loading and  
 unloading facilities 

 •  Coordinate LPG supply with 
 other schedulers and traders to     
 capture market opportunities 

 Qualifications:
 •  Business Administration degree, 

 or related work experience 
 •  Highly motivated with well-

 developed communication skills 
 •  Must be a self-starter and 

 comfortable working under 
 minimal supervision 

 •  Able to contribute within a 
 team environment 

 •  Has demonstrated analytical, 
 problem solving and excellent 
 computer skills 

 Plains offers a competitive benefits package including medical, 
 dental, life and  long-term disability insurance as well as employer-
 matched 401(k) plan. 

 Plains Marketing, L.P. 
 Attention: Scheduling Position – John Kraft 
 608 West 23rd, Yankton, SD 57078 
 Fax: (605) 260-0576 
 Email: john.kraft@plainsmidstream.com

 Please submit 
 resume and 

 references by 
 July 6 to:  

 The city of Vermillion, SD is seeking 
 candidates to serve as the next Fire Chief.  

 Salary commensurate with qualifications.  A 
 job description and application instructions 

 are available at 
 www.vermillion.us or call 605-677-7050. 

  First review of applications 
 July 16, 2012.

 Fire Chief
1400 Services
PREGNANT AND AFRAID?
C a l l  
Birthright 665-5580 (Yankton); 
258-3436 (Sioux City); 334-
8 4 1 1  
(Sioux Falls); 1-800-550-4900
( t o l l  
free).

1315 Drivers
Class“A” CDL drivers. Over-
night travel. Immediate open-
ings. Apply in person at 3206 E 
Hwy. 50, Yankton. Speak with 
Tammy or Rick. The Road Guy 
Construction.

Wanted OTR Reefer Drivers, 
better wages. Be home more 
than the big companies. Lump-
ers paid. Practical miles paid. 
Plus much more. Check us 
out. Sometimes there is more 
green on the otherside of the 
f e n c e .  
(605)366-0670/(605)484-4861.

1335 Other Employment
Custom Curbing Co.

& 
Yankton Irrigation

Seaonal help wanted: Must 
have lawn irrigation experi-
ence. (605)665-4582.

LIVE-WORK-PARTY-PLAY!  
Play in Vegas, Hang in LA, Jet 
to NYC!  Hiring 18-24 girls/ 
guys.  $400-$800 wkly.  Paid 
expenses. Signing Bonus.  
1-866-251-0768 (MCN)

WORK ON JET ENGINES - 
Train for hands on Aviation 
Maintenance Career. FAA ap-
proved program. Financial aid 
if qualified - Housing available 
CALL Aviation Institute of 
Maintenance 866-231-7177. 
(MCN).

MIDWEST FREE COMMU-
NITY PAPERS: Seeks a 
self-motivated professional for 
the position of EXECUTIVE DI-
RECTOR - Eligible candidate 
must demonstrate a proven 
track record in sales and mar-
keting, management and lead-
ership, and possess excellent 
human relations and communi-
cation skills. Previous experi-
ence in and/or knowledge of 
the free paper industry is pre-
ferred. Please send resume, 
cover letter, compensation re-
quirements and references to: 
search@mypaper.com (MCN)

Press Operator/Mechanic: 
The Times-Republican, a 
seven-day daily newspaper 
and three-shift commercial 
printing plant located in Mar-
shalltown, Iowa, is looking for a 
lead press operator and press 
mechanic. The successful can-
didate will have experience 
running and maintaining a 
Goss Community press or 
similar press with extensive 
knowledge of press mainte-
nance procedures and repairs 
capability. We are part of a 
40-newspaper group of family 
owned newspapers and print-
ing plants with excellent pay, 
benefits and opportunities for 
advancement. Please e-mail 
your cover letter, resume and 
references to trpub@timesre-
publican.com or via regular 
mail to: Mike Schlesinger, Pub-
lisher; Marshalltown Times-Re-
publican; 135 West Main 
Street/PO Box 1300; Marshall-
town, Iowa 50158 (MCN)
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