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 ESTATE
 AUCTION

 SATURDAY, AUGUST 3, 2013
 LOCATED: CITY AUDITORIUM, 119 N. MAIN ST, 

 RANDOLPH, NE

 AUCTION STARTS @ 10:00 A.M.                    
 LUNCH BY ST. FRANCES CYO 

 AUCTIONEERS NOTE: MAKE YOUR PLANS TO ATTEND ANOTHER FINE 
 AUCTION FOR THE JOE SCHLICHTING ESTATE. 

 ANTIQUES & COLLECTIBLES:   Oak 4 & 3 Section Stackable Bookcases; 
 Oak 2 Door Bookcase W/ Claw Feet; Mahogany Corner Hutch; Wooden 5 
 Drawer High Boy Chest Of Drawers; Oak 3 Drawer Chest Of Drawers; Walnut 
 Chest Of Drawer W/ Hankie Drawers & Marble Top; Wooden 2 Door China/
 bookcase W/ Drop Front; Oak Library Table; Handmade Oak Cedar Chest; 
 Pine Church Pew; Waterfall Desk; Claw Foot Organ Stool; Wooden Rockers; 
 Wooden Bedroom Set; Majestic Radio & Turn Table; Sets Of Wooden 
 Chairs; Treadle Sewing Machine; Vintage Baby Bed; Newer 2 & 4 Door 
 Stackable Bookcases; Pitcher & Bowl; 6 Drawer Wooden Spool Cabinet; 2 
 Drawer Spool Cabinet; Chicago Water & Sewer Lantern; Knives; Amber, 
 Green & Pink Depression Glass; Blue Fenton Glassware; Red Ruby 
 Glassware; Nice Offering Of Carnival Glass; Peace Pipes; Wooden Duck 
 Decoys; Mccoy Pottery Planters; Quilts; Fancy Work; Salt & Pepper 
 Collection; Adverting Tins; Stoneware; Redwing 25 Gallon Leaf Crock; 
 Brown Top Jugs, Redwing 3 Gallon Crock; Western 3 Gallon Crock; Ruckles 
 Open Crocks   ADVERTISING ITEMS :  Devore & Deines – Randolph Advt. 
 Match Box; R. E. Lewis – Randolph, Nebr Chain Picture; Huwaldt Service, 
 Schomberg Lumber Randolph Advt. Pictures; Security State Bank Osmond 
 & State Bank Of Belden – Coin Banks; Advertising Pencils   TOYS: 
 Assortment Of Toy Trucks, Construction Toys, Toy Airplanes; Erector Set; Cap 
 Guns; Misc. Farm Toys, Toy Cars; Misc. Pressed Steel Toys

 JOE SCHLICHTING ESTATE

 TERMS: CASH – OR BANKABLE CHECK – NOT 
 RESPONSIBLE FOR ACCIDENTS OR THEFT

 SEE www.MCHJAUCTIONEERS.COM FOR LISTING & PHOTOS

 AUCTION CONDUCTED BY:
 CREAMER HEIMES JANSSEN AUCTIONEERS & APPRAISERS L.L.C.

 HARTINGTON, NEBRASKA
 RYAN CREAMER 402-254-9753 • ALTON HEIMES 402-254-3315

 ROGER JANSSEN: 402-388-4409

 •AFFORDABLE RENT 
 ADJUSTMENT FOR YOUR INCOME

 •LARGE 2 AND 3 BEDROOM RENTAL UNITS
 •STOVE, REFRIGERATOR & AIR CONDITIONING
 •OFF-STREET PARKING AND PLUG-INS
 •UTILITIES INCLUDED
 •ON-SITE COIN LAUNDRY
 •PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT & SAND BOX
 •3 BLOCKS FROM CAMPUS

 O AKWOOD  A PARTMENTS

EQUAL HOUSING
OPPORTUNITY

 IMMEDIATE OPENINGS

 CALL NIKKI OR DAVE

 (605) 624-9557

 Rasmussen Motors

 REBATES OF 
 UP TO $5500* 

 2013 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 
 2500HD LT

 Reg Cab, Long Box, 4x4
 6.0L V8, 6 spd Auto, A/C, Tilt, Cruise, Camper 

 Mirrors, Off Road Package, H/D Trailering

 $ 30,995 *

 *after rebates, must trade 
 in ‘99 or newer, qualifying 

 GM car or truck

 View Entire Inventory Online At  www.rasmussenmotors.com

 209 W. Cherry, Vermillion, SD • 624-4438 • 1-800-568-5004
 Mon.-Fri. 7:30 a.m.-5:30 p.m. • Sat. 8 a.m.-3 p.m. • OPEN NIGHTS BY APPOINTMENT

 Ric Rasmussen
 624-5204

 Gary Rasmussen
 624-9612

 Randy Rasmussen
 624-1098

 1221 Cornell St., Vermillion, SD • 605-624-5642
 201 NW 13th St., Ste. 3, Beresford, SD  • 800-560-2518

 1-800-560-2518

  TODD’S   TODD’S  TODD’S 
 

 
ELECTRIC SERVICE ELECTRIC SERVICE ELECTRIC SERVICE
 Design/Build • Fiber Cabling • Commercial • Residential

  Service Calls • Boom Truck with Auger • Trenching

 Serving the 
 Beresford and 

 Vermillion Areas

 “The Line To Power”

 BOB’S
 Parking Lot Striping

 605-670-0288
 FREE ESTIMATES

By Travis Gulbrandson
travis.gulbrandson@plaintalk.net

Summertime usually is a
slow period on the campus
of the University of South
Dakota.

That’s not the case this
year, however, with crews
hard at work on the $11.6
million expansion of the
Muenster University Center
(MUC).

“It’s really taken shape
over the summer,” said Phil
Carter, media relations
representative for USD.
“The weather has
cooperated, with the
conditions being dry and
favorable. Over the winter
and into spring was kind of
hinky, but I think by that
time construction had
started to evolve into
interior work.”

The 31,000 square foot
expansion began late last
fall, with exterior work,
Carter said. 

Through the spring and
summer the project has
included placement of
additional steel beams,
pouring the floors, and
work on the exterior
enclosure of the new
addition. 

The piping and
plumbing was already

completed by April of this
year.

The completed facility
will feature expanded
seating and national
restaurant options, such as
Chick-fil-A, Qdoba and
Einstein Bros. Bagels.

Aramark also will
continue to offer dining
options for students and
visitors.

“The students have
generally had an input when
it comes to dining options,”
Carter said. “Obviously,
when it comes to living on
campus, that’s part of the
opportunity – to dine on
campus.” 

Input was also received
from “those who commute,
and faculty and staff who
enjoy eating here on
campus,” he added. “So, a
variety of those factors
played into expanding the
dining options.”

Sustainability also is a
consideration in the project,
with contractors using
LEED Silver certification
materials to promote
further efficiency of the
MUC. 

According to its official
Web site, “LEED is a green
building tool that addresses
the entire building lifecycle
recognizing best-in-class
building strategies.”

“It’s a way for
contractors as well as us to
be sustainable
environmental stewards,”
Carter said.

The project’s general
contractor is Sioux Falls
Construction, with design
of the new addition handled
by RS Architects, also of
Sioux Falls.

Work is taking place
between the original MUC
building and the I.D. Weeks
Library, necessitating the
closure of the “link”
students use to pass back
and forth.

Carter said that beyond
“little inconveniences here
and there,” students will be
largely unaffected by the
work.

“We’re hoping that we
can have some of the
options open by the start of

the 2014 spring semester,”
he said.

The original MUC
building opened in
February 2009, and
expansions of it have been
discussed since USD
President James Abbot’s
state of the university
address in 2011.

“Even though the facility
is relatively new, our student
enrollment was growing at
such a good pace it made
sense just to add on and
provide more dining
options, more seating
options, more areas for
students to use the
Muenster University Center
to relax,” Carter said. “It is
their place, and since their
base is growing, I guess it all
kind of factored in with
that. …

“Whenever you have one

a facility like the MUC on
campus and you start
growing, it just makes sense
for that facility to expand,
sooner rather than later,” he
said.

Last spring, Jeff Baylor,
vice president of marketing,
enrollment and student
services at USD, was quoted
as saying the campus
community and future
students are “very excited”
for the completion of the
project.

“Since opening in 2009,
the Muenster University

Center has certainly
impacted the quality of
student life at USD whether
students are hanging out
with friends, watching the
big game or one of their
favorite shows on one of the
facility’s high definition
TVs, or simply grabbing a
bite to eat. It’s the focal
point of campus. It’s USD’s
‘living room,’ so to speak.”

Construction updates
can be found on Facebook
at
www.facebook.com/Univers
ityofSouthDakota. 

MUC expansion
continuing at
rapid pace

The 31,000 square foot expansion of the Muenster University Center (MUC) began late last fall, with exterior work.
Through the spring and summer the project has included placement of additional steel beams, pouring the floors, and
work on the exterior enclosure of the new addition. (Photo by Travis Gulbrandson)

One & two bedroom 
apartments.  Wakonda 
Apartments, 611 First St. 
Wakonda, SD 57073. 
Laundry. Rental assistance 
available to those who 
qualify. For appointments or 
applications please call 
605-624-5218 or visit 
www.oakleafpm.com.

Equal  Housing Opportunity 

 Outstanding, 2-day Gun 
 Auction of the Lifetime 
 Collection of Dick Kafka

 Friday August 9th 4:00 pm &
 Saturday August 10th 10:00 am

 BILL & DORIS FICKBOHM  --- OWNERS
 605-563-2039

 Located:  Wagner 
 National Guard Armory 
 on Hwy 46, Wagner, SD

 Friday Aug 9th at 4:00 p.m.:  
 Handguns, Military Memorabilia, and More:  
 Over 170 Handguns!   Includes Several Colts —
 1851 Navy, 1877 Lighting, 1892, 1908, 1911, Police 
 Positive, Woodsman, and more.  Smith & Wesson--  1871 Schofield, 
 1905 .38, several smaller revolvers;   Other Handguns including--
 Remington & Sons, H&A, Smith & Wesson, Iver Johnson, H&R, Remington; 
 Webley & Scott; Luger Broom Handles; Foreign Military; Jennings; 
 Savage, Ruger, Steven’s Tip-up Collection; Mauser, Deutsche-Werke, and 
 many more.  Includes Revolvers, Autos, Pinfires, Rimfires, Pepperboxes, 
 Black Powder, Double Barrels; & Pellet Pistols; also several lots of 
 German & US Military Memorabilia, antique revolver holsters and other 
 related memorabilia.

 DAY 2:  Saturday August 10th at 10:00 a.m.—
 200+ Rifles, Shotguns, Military, Swords, Shells 
 & More.    A brief list of highlights includes:  Winchesters;   1866 
 Yellow Boy .44-40; 1873 38-40 Oct bbl; 1876 45-60; 1885 Lo-Wall 25-
 20; 1892 32WCF; 94 30-30 early Model; 1895 30-40 Krag; 1887 10ga; 
 36 9mm Shotgun;  1890 .22short; 1890 .22 WRF; 1902 .22; 03 .22; 
 1906 .22; 1904 .22; 425 SS Air Rifle .22cal; Post 64 94 30-30; many 
 more .22’s;  Springfield:   1881 20ga Forager—1st Year Production w/ 
 2-digit SN#!  1884 47-70 Saddle Ring Carbine; 1884 45-70; 1873 50-
 70 Cadet; 1869 50-70; 1884 45-7; 1873 45-70 1884 45-70 Cadet; 
 1898 30-40 Krag;  1898 30-40 Krag Carbine; M-1 .30cal; Saginaw M-1 
 Carbine; Rare Springfield Trowel Bayonet w/ sheath; several other 
 bayonets & accessories;  Rifles:  Remington #4 .22 Rifle Conversion to 
 Pistol Boxed Set-beautiful!  Colt Lighting .22cal; Marlin 1881 45-70 
 Govt; Marlin 92 .32cal Oct bbl; Savage 99 250-3000; Savage 99 303; 
 Rem Rolling Block 50-70; Super Collection of US & Foreign Military 
 rifles—Lee Enfield #1, Spencer 56x56 Civil War issue; Enfield #4 Mark 1; 
 1917 Eddystone; Large collection .22cal rifles—Qukenbusch, Rem Nylon, 
 Crackshots, Single Shots—many Winchesters; BB Guns;  Shotguns:   Rem 
 Forager Rolling Block 12ga; many more Ithica, Remington, Winchester, & 
 more.  Unusual guns including many antique Double Barrel & Single 
 Shots, Pinfires, Open Hammers, & More;  Swords:   Several including US 
 Army WWII Patton w/ Scabbard-mint; Prussian German Officer’s; Civil War 
 Officer’s; German field Sword; several fancy Fraternal Dress Swords; 
 1917 Trench Knife; assort bayonets; Also many lots of antique shell 
 boxes, cartridges, bullet molds, and more. 

 Terms:    Cash, Good Check, Visa, MasterCard.  10% Buyer’s Premium 
 on Internet & Absentee bids only.  Absentee bids welcomed & 
 encouraged.  Photo ID required to register at auction. All Federal 
 Firearms Laws apply.  SD sales Tax applies. 

 Note:    This is auction is 100% the personal collection of Mr. Kafka’s.  
 He sought out unusual variations, unique features, and all in good, old 
 original condition.    Make plans to attend, you won’t be disappointed!

 Live Internet bidding available through GirardBid.com!  
 Fully cataloged auction.  Bid there without being there!

 Over 350 
 Firearms 
 offered!

 Girard Auction 
 & Land Brokers, Inc.
 (605) 267-2421
  Toll Free:  1-866-531-6186

 Marv Girard, BA #12399; Ken Girard, CAI, AARE Broker #10183; 
 Mike Girard, CAI, BA #13549; Mike Manning, BA #11605

 www.GirardAuction.com

 In full cooperation with:
 Peterson Auctioneers, Springfield, SD

 (605) 369-2638
 www.PetersonAuctioneers.com

 Advertise your Garage Sale to 
 thousands of readers! 

 624-4429

 Turn Your Clutter 

 into   Cash!
 Buy Local!
 Shop the 

 Classifieds!


