
SAMPLE BALLOT 
 

SAMPLE BALLOT 
 

OFFICIAL MUNICIPAL ELECTION BALLOT 
VERMILLION, SOUTH DAKOTA 

June 30, 2015 
 

The following initiated and referred measures were proposed by petition for submission to the voters.  These initiated and 
referred measures will not become effective unless approved by majority vote. 
 

Initiated Measure 
 

Title: The repeal of Title XI, Business Regulations, Chapter 112 Alcoholic Beverages, Sections 112.24 through 112.31 of the 
2008 Revised Ordinances of the City of Vermillion, South Dakota, imposing a charge upon malt beverage purchases pursuant 
to SDCL 35-4-60.2. 
 
City Attorney’s Explanation: The City of Vermillion was presented with a municipal initiative petition asking the above 
proposal be submitted to the voters for adoption or rejection. 
 
The initiated proposal would repeal a recent ordinance passed by the City’s governing body that imposes a fee of five percent 
of the wholesale purchase price, plus freight, on certain malt beverage purchases in the City effective July 1, 2015. 
 
The ordinance specifies that the malt beverages subject to the fee be purchased from the City, or, alternatively, that the fee be 
paid according to monthly statements received from the City based on wholesalers’ invoices. 
 
The ordinance contains enforcement procedures available to the City for noncompliant license holders, and restricts the City’s 
use of the collected fees to retire the general obligation bonds issued for Prentis Park improvements and/or maintenance, 
operation, expansion or improvements to parks or park facilities in the City. 
 
The ordinance provides for a yearly regular meeting agenda item of the City’s governing body to update the community on use 
of past and future funds collected, to gather input regarding continuation of the fee, and for mailed notice of the agenda item to 
license holders. 
 
______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
To vote use a cross (x) or check mark () in the square in front of “Yes” or “No.” 
______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 

 Yes   A vote “Yes” will repeal the malt beverage fee ordinance. 
 

 No   A vote “No” will retain the malt beverage fee ordinance. 
 
 
 
 

Referred Measure 
 

Title: An ordinance amending Title XI, adding Chapter 121, Day Care, to the 2008 Revised Ordinances of the City of 
Vermillion, South Dakota,  creating a requirement for day care businesses to register with the City of Vermillion and provide 
for certain health and safety requirements.  
 
City Attorney’s Explanation: The City of Vermillion was presented with a municipal referendum petition asking the above 
ordinance as passed by the City’s governing body be submitted to the voters for adoption or rejection. 
 
The referred ordinance would require day care businesses in the City providing regular care and supervision for five or more 
children as parental care supplement, with or without compensation, to register with the City of Vermillion every two years.  
 
The ordinance requires age minimums for day care providers and workers, cardiopulmonary resuscitation (CPR) certification 
for day care operators, sex offense registrant disqualification from day care employment or residence, and City inspections of 
day care premises to determine building and fire code compliance. The ordinance also makes fence, hedge, trellis or other 
barrier enclosures necessary for playground areas, unless parents or guardians of each child consent to lack of such enclosures 
at specific premises.  
 
Day care businesses registered with the state would not be subject to City inspections, but would still need to register with the 
City. A registration fee may be set by resolution of the City’s governing body, but to date a fee has not been established. 
 
______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
To vote use a cross (x) or check mark () in the square in front of “Yes” or “No.” 
______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 

 Yes   A vote “Yes” will adopt the day care registration ordinance. 
 

 No   A vote “No” will not adopt the day care registration ordinance. 
 
 

NOTICE OF SPECIAL
ELECTION

MUNICIPALITY OF
VERMILLION

A Special Election will be held on
June  30,  2015,  in  Vermillion,
South Dakota.  If the polls  cannot
be  opened  because  of  bad
weather,  the  election  may  be
postponed one week.

The  election  polls  will  be  open
from  seven  a.m.  to  seven  p.m.
central  standard  time  on  the  day
of the election.

At  the  election,  the  following
questions will be voted upon:

Initiated Measure

Title:  The  repeal  of  Title  XI,
Business  Regulations,  Chapter
112  Alcoholic  Beverages,
Sections  112.24  through  112.31
of  the  2008  Revised  Ordinances
of the  City  of Vermillion,  South
Dakota,  imposing  a  charge  upon
malt beverage purchases pursuant
to SDCL 35-4-60.2.

City  Attorney's  Explanation:  The
City  of Vermillion  was presented
with  a  municipal  initiative
petition asking the above proposal
be  submitted  to  the  voters  for
adoption or rejection.

The  initiated  proposal  would
repeal  a  recent  ordinance  passed
by the City's  governing body that
imposes  a  fee  of five  percent  of
the wholesale purchase price, plus
freight,  on  certain  malt  beverage
purchases  in  the  City  effective
July 1, 2015.

The  ordinance  specifies  that  the
malt  beverages subject  to the  fee
be  purchased  from  the  City,  or,
alternatively, that the  fee  be paid
according  to  monthly  statements
received  from the  City  based  on
wholesalers' invoices.

The  ordinance  contains  enforce-
ment  procedures  available  to  the
City  for  noncompliant  license
holders,  and  restricts  the  City's
use of the  collected  fees to retire
the  general  obligation  bonds
issued  for  Prentis  Park  improve-
ments and/or maintenance, opera-
tion,  expansion  or  improvements
to  parks  or  park  facilities  in  the
City.

The  ordinance  provides  for  a
yearly  regular  meeting  agenda
item of the City's governing body
to  update  the  community  on  use
of past and future funds collected,
to gather input regarding continu-
ation  of  the  fee,  and  for  mailed
notice  of  the  agenda  item  to
license holders.

Yes A  vote  “Yes”  will
repeal  the  malt  beverage  fee
ordinance.

No A  vote  “No”  will
retain  the  malt  beverage  fee
ordinance.

Referred Measure

Title:  An  ordinance  amending
Title  XI  ,  adding  Chapter
121,  Day  Care,  to  the  2008
Revised  Ordinances  of  the  City
of  Vermillion,  South  Dakota,
creating  a  requirement  for  day
care  businesses  to  register  with
the  City  of  Vermillion  and
provide  for  certain  health  and
safety requirements. 

City  Attorney's  Explanation:  The
City  of Vermillion  was presented
with  a  municipal  referendum
petition  asking  the  above
ordinance as passed by the City's
governing  body  be  submitted
to  the  voters  for  adoption  or
rejection.

The  referred  ordinance  would
require  day  care  businesses  in
the  City  providing  regular
care  and  supervision  for  five  or
more  children  as  parental  care
supplement,  with  or  without
compensation, to register with the
City  of  Vermillion  every  two
years. 

The  ordinance  requires  age
minimums for day care  providers
and  workers,  cardiopulmonary
resuscitation  (CPR)  certification
for day care operators, sex offense
registrant  disqualification  from
day  care  employment  or
residence, and City inspections of
day  care  premises  to  determine
building  and  fire  code  compli-
ance.  The  ordinance  also  makes
fence,  hedge,  trellis  or  other
barrier  enclosures  necessary  for
playground  areas,  unless  parents
or guardians of each child consent
to  lack  of  such  enclosures  at
specific premises. 

Day  care  businesses  registered
with  the  state  would  not  be
subject  to  City  inspections,  but
would  still  need  to  register  with
the  City.  A  registration  fee  may
be set by  resolution  of the  City's
governing body, but to date a fee
has not been established.

Yes A  vote  “Yes”  will
adopt  the  day  care  registration
ordinance.

No A vote  “No”  will  not
adopt  day  the  care  registration
ordinance.

The polling place in each ward of
this municipality is as follows:

National  Guard  Armory/
Community Center 603 Princeton
Street

Voters  with  disabilities  may
contact  the  finance  officer  for
information and special assistance
in  absentee  voting  or  polling
place accessibility

The entire Initiated Measure  is as
follows:

Be  it  ordained  that  title  XI
Business  Regulations,  Chapter
112  Alcoholic  Beverages  of  the
Revised  Ordinances  of  the  City
of  Vermillion,  South  Dakota
sections  112.24  through  112.31
imposing  a  charge  upon  malt
beverages  purchases  pursuant  to
SDCL  35-4-60.2  are  hereby
repealed.

The  entire  Referred  Measure  is
ordinance number 1326 that is as
follows:

ORDINANCE NUMBER 1326
AN  ORDINANCE  AMENDING
TITLE  XI,  ADDING CHAPTER
121,  DAY CARE, TO THE 2008
REVISED  ORDINANCES  OF
THE  CITY  OF  VERMILLION,
SOUTH  DAKOTA,  CREATING
A  REQUIREMENT  FOR  DAY-
CARE BUSINESSES TO REGIS-
TER WITH THE CITY OF VER-
MILLION  AND  PROVIDING
FOR  CERTAIN  HEALTH  AND
SAFETY REQUIREMENTS. 

WHEREAS,  the  governing  body
of  the  City  of  Vermillion  has
deemed  these  regulations  and
controls  to  be  reasonable  and
related  to  the  purpose of promot-
ing the health, safety, and general
welfare of the City of Vermillion.

NOW,  THEREFORE,  BE  IT
ORDAINED,  by  the  governing
body  of  the  City  of  Vermillion,
South  Dakota,  that  there  be
enacted  a  requirement  for  all
day  care  businesses  within  the
corporate  limits  of  Vermillion  to
be  registered  with  the  City  of
Vermillion and Chapter 121 shall
be added to Title XI as follows:

121.01 Definitions. The following
words,  terms  and  phrases,  when
used in this article, shall have the
meanings provided in this section,
except  where  the  context  clearly
indicates a different meaning:
“Home  day  care”  means  the
providing  of  group  care  and
supervision  of  five  or  more
children on a regular basis for part
of a day, with or without compen-
sation, as a supplement to regular
parental  care,  including  children
under the age of six living in the
home  and  children  from  more
than one unrelated  family  receiv-
ing day care. (This definition may
encompass  Day  Care,  Family
and  Day  Care,  Group  activities
defined in the Vermillion  Zoning
Regulations, Chapter 155.)
“Home day care home” means the
private  residence  wherein  day
care is provided.
“Provider”  means  the  principal
caretaker  of children  in  a  family
day care home. 

121.02  Required.  Every  person
engaged  in  the  business  of
operating  a  home day care  shall,
before engaging in such business,
register with  the  City  of  Vermil-
lion  as  provided  in  this  article.
The fee for such registration shall
be set by resolution.

121.03  Application.  Any  person
desiring  to  register  as  provided
in  this  article  shall  file  with  the
City  Finance  Officer  a  written
application  on  a  form  provided
by the City. The application shall
be  signed  by  each  adult  at  least
18  years  of  age  operating  the
day  care.  The  application  shall
contain,  at  a  minimum,  the
following information:

1.  A  floor  plan  of  the
proposed location;

2.   The expected number and
age  range  of  the  children  being
cared for.
Registration  to  engage  in  the
business  of  home  day  care
operation  shall  be  valid  until  the
next June 30 in an even numbered
year.  Applications  for  renewal
shall be submitted within 45 days
of  the  expiration  of  the  current
registration.

121.04  Central  registry  for  child
abuse  and  neglect/sex  offender
registry. No person whose name is
currently,  or  at  any  time  in  the
past has been on the state  central
registry for abuse and neglect, the
state sex offender registry, or any
similar registry or list  maintained
by  any  other  state,  shall  reside
in  the  premises  in  which  the
home  day care  business  is  being
conducted,  nor  shall  such  person
be  employed  in  any  capacity  by
the  home  day  care.  Applicant
shall  provide  an  affidavit  to  this
extent. 

121.05  Age  requirements.  No
person under 18 years of age may
be  registered  under  this  article.
No  person  between  14  years
of age  and 17 years  of age may
provide  child  care  services  in  a
home day care unless a registered
home  day  care  provider  is
actually  present  in the  home  day
care facility.

121.06  CPR  required.  All  home
day  care  operators  registered
under this article must maintain a
current  cardiopulmonary  resusci-
tation  (CPR)  certification  from
the American Red Cross or Amer-
ican  Heart  Association.  Employ-
ees of a home day care are recom-
mended to have such certification.

121.07 Inspections. Any day care
licensed under this article shall be
inspected  by  the  Fire  Chief,  or
designee,  prior  to  registration
approval.  All  home  daycares
shall  be  open  to  announced  or
unannounced  inspection  by  city
officials  at  any  time  during
normal  business  hours.  The  Fire
Chief or designee shall  re-inspect
each premise prior to recommend-
ing the renewal of registration.
Exception:  All  home  day
cares  registered  by  July  1,  2015
will  not  be  required  to  complete
an  inspection  for  the  initial
registration.

121.08  Fencing  or  other  barrier.
Playground  areas  shall  be
enclosed by a fence, hedge, trellis,
or  other  barrier not  less  than  42
inches  high  to  protect  the  area
from  traffic,  animals,  or  other
hazards.  Openings  in  a  fence,
trellis,  or  other  manmade  barrier
shall  not  allow  passage  of
a  four-inch  diameter  sphere.
Playground  areas  shall  be  in
rear yard whenever possible.  Day
care  center  fence  requirements
contained  in  Vermillion  Zoning
Regulations,  Chapter  155,  will
prevail  to  the  extent  they  apply
and conflict with this provision.
Exception:  A  registered  daycare
provider may be exempt from the
fencing  or  other  barrier  require-
ment  of  this  section  if  a  written
consent  form signed  by a  parent
or  guardian  of  each  child  being
cared for  stating  they understand
that  there  is  not  an  enclosed
playground  area at  the  registered
location. 

121.09  Building  code  require-
ments  applicable.  Nothing  in
this  article  shall  be  construed  to
exempt  any  structure  from  any
otherwise  applicable  portion  of
the  relevant  building  code  or
fire  code.  In  any  case  where  the
building code requirements are in
conflict  with  the  requirements  of
this  article,  the  more  stringent
requirement shall apply. 

121.11 State registered home day
cares. Any home day care  which
falls  within  the  scope  of  this
article but which is registered as a
family day care pursuant to SDCL
ch. 26-6 and ARSD ch. 67:42:03
shall  be  required  to  register
pursuant to this article. 

121.12  All  home  day  care
facilities  shall  comply  with  the
most recent version of the Interna-
tional Fire Code and International
Building  Code  as  modified  and
adopted by the City.

Adopted  the  6th  day  of  April,
2015.

_________________________
Michael  D.  Carlson,  Finance
Officer

Published  twice  at  the  total
approximate cost of $239.51.
Publish: June 19 & 26, 2015.

NOTICE OF SPECIAL
ELECTION

MUNICIPALITY OF
VERMILLION

A Special Election will be held on
June  30,  2015,  in  Vermillion,
South Dakota.  If the polls  cannot
be  opened  because  of  bad
weather,  the  election  may  be
postponed one week.

The  election  polls  will  be  open
from  seven  a.m.  to  seven  p.m.
central  standard  time  on  the  day
of the election.

At  the  election,  the  following
questions will be voted upon:

Initiated Measure

Title:  The  repeal  of  Title  XI,
Business  Regulations,  Chapter
112  Alcoholic  Beverages,
Sections  112.24  through  112.31
of  the  2008  Revised  Ordinances
of the  City  of Vermillion,  South
Dakota,  imposing  a  charge  upon
malt beverage purchases pursuant
to SDCL 35-4-60.2.

City  Attorney's  Explanation:  The
City  of Vermillion  was presented
with  a  municipal  initiative
petition asking the above proposal
be  submitted  to  the  voters  for
adoption or rejection.

The  initiated  proposal  would
repeal  a  recent  ordinance  passed
by the City's  governing body that
imposes  a  fee  of five  percent  of
the wholesale purchase price, plus
freight,  on  certain  malt  beverage
purchases  in  the  City  effective
July 1, 2015.

The  ordinance  specifies  that  the
malt  beverages subject  to the  fee
be  purchased  from  the  City,  or,
alternatively, that the  fee  be paid
according  to  monthly  statements
received  from the  City  based  on
wholesalers' invoices.

The  ordinance  contains  enforce-
ment  procedures  available  to  the
City  for  noncompliant  license
holders,  and  restricts  the  City's
use of the  collected  fees to retire
the  general  obligation  bonds
issued  for  Prentis  Park  improve-
ments and/or maintenance, opera-
tion,  expansion  or  improvements
to  parks  or  park  facilities  in  the
City.

The  ordinance  provides  for  a
yearly  regular  meeting  agenda
item of the City's governing body
to  update  the  community  on  use
of past and future funds collected,
to gather input regarding continu-
ation  of  the  fee,  and  for  mailed
notice  of  the  agenda  item  to
license holders.

Yes A  vote  “Yes”  will
repeal  the  malt  beverage  fee
ordinance.

No A  vote  “No”  will
retain  the  malt  beverage  fee
ordinance.

Referred Measure

Title:  An  ordinance  amending
Title  XI  ,  adding  Chapter
121,  Day  Care,  to  the  2008
Revised  Ordinances  of  the  City
of  Vermillion,  South  Dakota,
creating  a  requirement  for  day
care  businesses  to  register  with
the  City  of  Vermillion  and
provide  for  certain  health  and
safety requirements. 

City  Attorney's  Explanation:  The
City  of Vermillion  was presented
with  a  municipal  referendum
petition  asking  the  above
ordinance as passed by the City's
governing  body  be  submitted
to  the  voters  for  adoption  or
rejection.

The  referred  ordinance  would
require  day  care  businesses  in
the  City  providing  regular
care  and  supervision  for  five  or
more  children  as  parental  care
supplement,  with  or  without
compensation, to register with the
City  of  Vermillion  every  two
years. 

The  ordinance  requires  age
minimums for day care  providers
and  workers,  cardiopulmonary
resuscitation  (CPR)  certification
for day care operators, sex offense
registrant  disqualification  from
day  care  employment  or
residence, and City inspections of
day  care  premises  to  determine
building  and  fire  code  compli-
ance.  The  ordinance  also  makes
fence,  hedge,  trellis  or  other
barrier  enclosures  necessary  for
playground  areas,  unless  parents
or guardians of each child consent
to  lack  of  such  enclosures  at
specific premises. 

Day  care  businesses  registered
with  the  state  would  not  be
subject  to  City  inspections,  but
would  still  need  to  register  with
the  City.  A  registration  fee  may
be set by  resolution  of the  City's
governing body, but to date a fee
has not been established.

Yes A  vote  “Yes”  will
adopt  the  day  care  registration
ordinance.

No A vote  “No”  will  not
adopt  day  the  care  registration
ordinance.

The polling place in each ward of
this municipality is as follows:

National  Guard  Armory/
Community Center 603 Princeton
Street

Voters  with  disabilities  may
contact  the  finance  officer  for
information and special assistance
in  absentee  voting  or  polling
place accessibility

The entire Initiated Measure  is as
follows:

Be  it  ordained  that  title  XI
Business  Regulations,  Chapter
112  Alcoholic  Beverages  of  the
Revised  Ordinances  of  the  City
of  Vermillion,  South  Dakota
sections  112.24  through  112.31
imposing  a  charge  upon  malt
beverages  purchases  pursuant  to
SDCL  35-4-60.2  are  hereby
repealed.

The  entire  Referred  Measure  is
ordinance number 1326 that is as
follows:

ORDINANCE NUMBER 1326
AN  ORDINANCE  AMENDING
TITLE  XI,  ADDING CHAPTER
121,  DAY CARE, TO THE 2008
REVISED  ORDINANCES  OF
THE  CITY  OF  VERMILLION,
SOUTH  DAKOTA,  CREATING
A  REQUIREMENT  FOR  DAY-
CARE BUSINESSES TO REGIS-
TER WITH THE CITY OF VER-
MILLION  AND  PROVIDING
FOR  CERTAIN  HEALTH  AND
SAFETY REQUIREMENTS. 

WHEREAS,  the  governing  body
of  the  City  of  Vermillion  has
deemed  these  regulations  and
controls  to  be  reasonable  and
related  to  the  purpose of promot-
ing the health, safety, and general
welfare of the City of Vermillion.

NOW,  THEREFORE,  BE  IT
ORDAINED,  by  the  governing
body  of  the  City  of  Vermillion,
South  Dakota,  that  there  be
enacted  a  requirement  for  all
day  care  businesses  within  the
corporate  limits  of  Vermillion  to
be  registered  with  the  City  of
Vermillion and Chapter 121 shall
be added to Title XI as follows:

121.01 Definitions. The following
words,  terms  and  phrases,  when
used in this article, shall have the
meanings provided in this section,
except  where  the  context  clearly
indicates a different meaning:
“Home  day  care”  means  the
providing  of  group  care  and
supervision  of  five  or  more
children on a regular basis for part
of a day, with or without compen-
sation, as a supplement to regular
parental  care,  including  children
under the age of six living in the
home  and  children  from  more
than one unrelated  family  receiv-
ing day care. (This definition may
encompass  Day  Care,  Family
and  Day  Care,  Group  activities
defined in the Vermillion  Zoning
Regulations, Chapter 155.)
“Home day care home” means the
private  residence  wherein  day
care is provided.
“Provider”  means  the  principal
caretaker  of children  in  a  family
day care home. 

121.02  Required.  Every  person
engaged  in  the  business  of
operating  a  home day care  shall,
before engaging in such business,
register with  the  City  of  Vermil-
lion  as  provided  in  this  article.
The fee for such registration shall
be set by resolution.

121.03  Application.  Any  person
desiring  to  register  as  provided
in  this  article  shall  file  with  the
City  Finance  Officer  a  written
application  on  a  form  provided
by the City. The application shall
be  signed  by  each  adult  at  least
18  years  of  age  operating  the
day  care.  The  application  shall
contain,  at  a  minimum,  the
following information:

1.  A  floor  plan  of  the
proposed location;

2.   The expected number and
age  range  of  the  children  being
cared for.
Registration  to  engage  in  the
business  of  home  day  care
operation  shall  be  valid  until  the
next June 30 in an even numbered
year.  Applications  for  renewal
shall be submitted within 45 days
of  the  expiration  of  the  current
registration.

121.04  Central  registry  for  child
abuse  and  neglect/sex  offender
registry. No person whose name is
currently,  or  at  any  time  in  the
past has been on the state  central
registry for abuse and neglect, the
state sex offender registry, or any
similar registry or list  maintained
by  any  other  state,  shall  reside
in  the  premises  in  which  the
home  day care  business  is  being
conducted,  nor  shall  such  person
be  employed  in  any  capacity  by
the  home  day  care.  Applicant
shall  provide  an  affidavit  to  this
extent. 

121.05  Age  requirements.  No
person under 18 years of age may
be  registered  under  this  article.
No  person  between  14  years
of age  and 17 years  of age may
provide  child  care  services  in  a
home day care unless a registered
home  day  care  provider  is
actually  present  in the  home  day
care facility.

121.06  CPR  required.  All  home
day  care  operators  registered
under this article must maintain a
current  cardiopulmonary  resusci-
tation  (CPR)  certification  from
the American Red Cross or Amer-
ican  Heart  Association.  Employ-
ees of a home day care are recom-
mended to have such certification.

121.07 Inspections. Any day care
licensed under this article shall be
inspected  by  the  Fire  Chief,  or
designee,  prior  to  registration
approval.  All  home  daycares
shall  be  open  to  announced  or
unannounced  inspection  by  city
officials  at  any  time  during
normal  business  hours.  The  Fire
Chief or designee shall  re-inspect
each premise prior to recommend-
ing the renewal of registration.
Exception:  All  home  day
cares  registered  by  July  1,  2015
will  not  be  required  to  complete
an  inspection  for  the  initial
registration.

121.08  Fencing  or  other  barrier.
Playground  areas  shall  be
enclosed by a fence, hedge, trellis,
or  other  barrier not  less  than  42
inches  high  to  protect  the  area
from  traffic,  animals,  or  other
hazards.  Openings  in  a  fence,
trellis,  or  other  manmade  barrier
shall  not  allow  passage  of
a  four-inch  diameter  sphere.
Playground  areas  shall  be  in
rear yard whenever possible.  Day
care  center  fence  requirements
contained  in  Vermillion  Zoning
Regulations,  Chapter  155,  will
prevail  to  the  extent  they  apply
and conflict with this provision.
Exception:  A  registered  daycare
provider may be exempt from the
fencing  or  other  barrier  require-
ment  of  this  section  if  a  written
consent  form signed  by a  parent
or  guardian  of  each  child  being
cared for  stating  they understand
that  there  is  not  an  enclosed
playground  area at  the  registered
location. 

121.09  Building  code  require-
ments  applicable.  Nothing  in
this  article  shall  be  construed  to
exempt  any  structure  from  any
otherwise  applicable  portion  of
the  relevant  building  code  or
fire  code.  In  any  case  where  the
building code requirements are in
conflict  with  the  requirements  of
this  article,  the  more  stringent
requirement shall apply. 

121.11 State registered home day
cares. Any home day care  which
falls  within  the  scope  of  this
article but which is registered as a
family day care pursuant to SDCL
ch. 26-6 and ARSD ch. 67:42:03
shall  be  required  to  register
pursuant to this article. 

121.12  All  home  day  care
facilities  shall  comply  with  the
most recent version of the Interna-
tional Fire Code and International
Building  Code  as  modified  and
adopted by the City.

Adopted  the  6th  day  of  April,
2015.

_________________________
Michael  D.  Carlson,  Finance
Officer

Published  twice  at  the  total
approximate cost of $239.51.
Publish: June 19 & 26, 2015.

NOTICE OF SPECIAL
ELECTION

MUNICIPALITY OF
VERMILLION

A Special Election will be held on
June  30,  2015,  in  Vermillion,
South Dakota.  If the polls  cannot
be  opened  because  of  bad
weather,  the  election  may  be
postponed one week.

The  election  polls  will  be  open
from  seven  a.m.  to  seven  p.m.
central  standard  time  on  the  day
of the election.

At  the  election,  the  following
questions will be voted upon:

Initiated Measure

Title:  The  repeal  of  Title  XI,
Business  Regulations,  Chapter
112  Alcoholic  Beverages,
Sections  112.24  through  112.31
of  the  2008  Revised  Ordinances
of the  City  of Vermillion,  South
Dakota,  imposing  a  charge  upon
malt beverage purchases pursuant
to SDCL 35-4-60.2.

City  Attorney's  Explanation:  The
City  of Vermillion  was presented
with  a  municipal  initiative
petition asking the above proposal
be  submitted  to  the  voters  for
adoption or rejection.

The  initiated  proposal  would
repeal  a  recent  ordinance  passed
by the City's  governing body that
imposes  a  fee  of five  percent  of
the wholesale purchase price, plus
freight,  on  certain  malt  beverage
purchases  in  the  City  effective
July 1, 2015.

The  ordinance  specifies  that  the
malt  beverages subject  to the  fee
be  purchased  from  the  City,  or,
alternatively, that the  fee  be paid
according  to  monthly  statements
received  from the  City  based  on
wholesalers' invoices.

The  ordinance  contains  enforce-
ment  procedures  available  to  the
City  for  noncompliant  license
holders,  and  restricts  the  City's
use of the  collected  fees to retire
the  general  obligation  bonds
issued  for  Prentis  Park  improve-
ments and/or maintenance, opera-
tion,  expansion  or  improvements
to  parks  or  park  facilities  in  the
City.

The  ordinance  provides  for  a
yearly  regular  meeting  agenda
item of the City's governing body
to  update  the  community  on  use
of past and future funds collected,
to gather input regarding continu-
ation  of  the  fee,  and  for  mailed
notice  of  the  agenda  item  to
license holders.

Yes A  vote  “Yes”  will
repeal  the  malt  beverage  fee
ordinance.

No A  vote  “No”  will
retain  the  malt  beverage  fee
ordinance.

Referred Measure

Title:  An  ordinance  amending
Title  XI  ,  adding  Chapter
121,  Day  Care,  to  the  2008
Revised  Ordinances  of  the  City
of  Vermillion,  South  Dakota,
creating  a  requirement  for  day
care  businesses  to  register  with
the  City  of  Vermillion  and
provide  for  certain  health  and
safety requirements. 

City  Attorney's  Explanation:  The
City  of Vermillion  was presented
with  a  municipal  referendum
petition  asking  the  above
ordinance as passed by the City's
governing  body  be  submitted
to  the  voters  for  adoption  or
rejection.

The  referred  ordinance  would
require  day  care  businesses  in
the  City  providing  regular
care  and  supervision  for  five  or
more  children  as  parental  care
supplement,  with  or  without
compensation, to register with the
City  of  Vermillion  every  two
years. 

The  ordinance  requires  age
minimums for day care  providers
and  workers,  cardiopulmonary
resuscitation  (CPR)  certification
for day care operators, sex offense
registrant  disqualification  from
day  care  employment  or
residence, and City inspections of
day  care  premises  to  determine
building  and  fire  code  compli-
ance.  The  ordinance  also  makes
fence,  hedge,  trellis  or  other
barrier  enclosures  necessary  for
playground  areas,  unless  parents
or guardians of each child consent
to  lack  of  such  enclosures  at
specific premises. 

Day  care  businesses  registered
with  the  state  would  not  be
subject  to  City  inspections,  but
would  still  need  to  register  with
the  City.  A  registration  fee  may
be set by  resolution  of the  City's
governing body, but to date a fee
has not been established.

Yes A  vote  “Yes”  will
adopt  the  day  care  registration
ordinance.

No A vote  “No”  will  not
adopt  day  the  care  registration
ordinance.

The polling place in each ward of
this municipality is as follows:

National  Guard  Armory/
Community Center 603 Princeton
Street

Voters  with  disabilities  may
contact  the  finance  officer  for
information and special assistance
in  absentee  voting  or  polling
place accessibility

The entire Initiated Measure  is as
follows:

Be  it  ordained  that  title  XI
Business  Regulations,  Chapter
112  Alcoholic  Beverages  of  the
Revised  Ordinances  of  the  City
of  Vermillion,  South  Dakota
sections  112.24  through  112.31
imposing  a  charge  upon  malt
beverages  purchases  pursuant  to
SDCL  35-4-60.2  are  hereby
repealed.

The  entire  Referred  Measure  is
ordinance number 1326 that is as
follows:

ORDINANCE NUMBER 1326
AN  ORDINANCE  AMENDING
TITLE  XI,  ADDING CHAPTER
121,  DAY CARE, TO THE 2008
REVISED  ORDINANCES  OF
THE  CITY  OF  VERMILLION,
SOUTH  DAKOTA,  CREATING
A  REQUIREMENT  FOR  DAY-
CARE BUSINESSES TO REGIS-
TER WITH THE CITY OF VER-
MILLION  AND  PROVIDING
FOR  CERTAIN  HEALTH  AND
SAFETY REQUIREMENTS. 

WHEREAS,  the  governing  body
of  the  City  of  Vermillion  has
deemed  these  regulations  and
controls  to  be  reasonable  and
related  to  the  purpose of promot-
ing the health, safety, and general
welfare of the City of Vermillion.

NOW,  THEREFORE,  BE  IT
ORDAINED,  by  the  governing
body  of  the  City  of  Vermillion,
South  Dakota,  that  there  be
enacted  a  requirement  for  all
day  care  businesses  within  the
corporate  limits  of  Vermillion  to
be  registered  with  the  City  of
Vermillion and Chapter 121 shall
be added to Title XI as follows:

121.01 Definitions. The following
words,  terms  and  phrases,  when
used in this article, shall have the
meanings provided in this section,
except  where  the  context  clearly
indicates a different meaning:
“Home  day  care”  means  the
providing  of  group  care  and
supervision  of  five  or  more
children on a regular basis for part
of a day, with or without compen-
sation, as a supplement to regular
parental  care,  including  children
under the age of six living in the
home  and  children  from  more
than one unrelated  family  receiv-
ing day care. (This definition may
encompass  Day  Care,  Family
and  Day  Care,  Group  activities
defined in the Vermillion  Zoning
Regulations, Chapter 155.)
“Home day care home” means the
private  residence  wherein  day
care is provided.
“Provider”  means  the  principal
caretaker  of children  in  a  family
day care home. 

121.02  Required.  Every  person
engaged  in  the  business  of
operating  a  home day care  shall,
before engaging in such business,
register with  the  City  of  Vermil-
lion  as  provided  in  this  article.
The fee for such registration shall
be set by resolution.

121.03  Application.  Any  person
desiring  to  register  as  provided
in  this  article  shall  file  with  the
City  Finance  Officer  a  written
application  on  a  form  provided
by the City. The application shall
be  signed  by  each  adult  at  least
18  years  of  age  operating  the
day  care.  The  application  shall
contain,  at  a  minimum,  the
following information:

1.  A  floor  plan  of  the
proposed location;

2.   The expected number and
age  range  of  the  children  being
cared for.
Registration  to  engage  in  the
business  of  home  day  care
operation  shall  be  valid  until  the
next June 30 in an even numbered
year.  Applications  for  renewal
shall be submitted within 45 days
of  the  expiration  of  the  current
registration.

121.04  Central  registry  for  child
abuse  and  neglect/sex  offender
registry. No person whose name is
currently,  or  at  any  time  in  the
past has been on the state  central
registry for abuse and neglect, the
state sex offender registry, or any
similar registry or list  maintained
by  any  other  state,  shall  reside
in  the  premises  in  which  the
home  day care  business  is  being
conducted,  nor  shall  such  person
be  employed  in  any  capacity  by
the  home  day  care.  Applicant
shall  provide  an  affidavit  to  this
extent. 

121.05  Age  requirements.  No
person under 18 years of age may
be  registered  under  this  article.
No  person  between  14  years
of age  and 17 years  of age may
provide  child  care  services  in  a
home day care unless a registered
home  day  care  provider  is
actually  present  in the  home  day
care facility.

121.06  CPR  required.  All  home
day  care  operators  registered
under this article must maintain a
current  cardiopulmonary  resusci-
tation  (CPR)  certification  from
the American Red Cross or Amer-
ican  Heart  Association.  Employ-
ees of a home day care are recom-
mended to have such certification.

121.07 Inspections. Any day care
licensed under this article shall be
inspected  by  the  Fire  Chief,  or
designee,  prior  to  registration
approval.  All  home  daycares
shall  be  open  to  announced  or
unannounced  inspection  by  city
officials  at  any  time  during
normal  business  hours.  The  Fire
Chief or designee shall  re-inspect
each premise prior to recommend-
ing the renewal of registration.
Exception:  All  home  day
cares  registered  by  July  1,  2015
will  not  be  required  to  complete
an  inspection  for  the  initial
registration.

121.08  Fencing  or  other  barrier.
Playground  areas  shall  be
enclosed by a fence, hedge, trellis,
or  other  barrier not  less  than  42
inches  high  to  protect  the  area
from  traffic,  animals,  or  other
hazards.  Openings  in  a  fence,
trellis,  or  other  manmade  barrier
shall  not  allow  passage  of
a  four-inch  diameter  sphere.
Playground  areas  shall  be  in
rear yard whenever possible.  Day
care  center  fence  requirements
contained  in  Vermillion  Zoning
Regulations,  Chapter  155,  will
prevail  to  the  extent  they  apply
and conflict with this provision.
Exception:  A  registered  daycare
provider may be exempt from the
fencing  or  other  barrier  require-
ment  of  this  section  if  a  written
consent  form signed  by a  parent
or  guardian  of  each  child  being
cared for  stating  they understand
that  there  is  not  an  enclosed
playground  area at  the  registered
location. 

121.09  Building  code  require-
ments  applicable.  Nothing  in
this  article  shall  be  construed  to
exempt  any  structure  from  any
otherwise  applicable  portion  of
the  relevant  building  code  or
fire  code.  In  any  case  where  the
building code requirements are in
conflict  with  the  requirements  of
this  article,  the  more  stringent
requirement shall apply. 

121.11 State registered home day
cares. Any home day care  which
falls  within  the  scope  of  this
article but which is registered as a
family day care pursuant to SDCL
ch. 26-6 and ARSD ch. 67:42:03
shall  be  required  to  register
pursuant to this article. 

121.12  All  home  day  care
facilities  shall  comply  with  the
most recent version of the Interna-
tional Fire Code and International
Building  Code  as  modified  and
adopted by the City.

Adopted  the  6th  day  of  April,
2015.

_________________________
Michael  D.  Carlson,  Finance
Officer

Published  twice  at  the  total
approximate cost of $239.51.
Publish: June 19 & 26, 2015.

NOTICE OF SPECIAL
ELECTION

MUNICIPALITY OF
VERMILLION

A Special Election will be held on
June  30,  2015,  in  Vermillion,
South Dakota.  If the polls  cannot
be  opened  because  of  bad
weather,  the  election  may  be
postponed one week.

The  election  polls  will  be  open
from  seven  a.m.  to  seven  p.m.
central  standard  time  on  the  day
of the election.

At  the  election,  the  following
questions will be voted upon:

Initiated Measure

Title:  The  repeal  of  Title  XI,
Business  Regulations,  Chapter
112  Alcoholic  Beverages,
Sections  112.24  through  112.31
of  the  2008  Revised  Ordinances
of the  City  of Vermillion,  South
Dakota,  imposing  a  charge  upon
malt beverage purchases pursuant
to SDCL 35-4-60.2.

City  Attorney's  Explanation:  The
City  of Vermillion  was presented
with  a  municipal  initiative
petition asking the above proposal
be  submitted  to  the  voters  for
adoption or rejection.

The  initiated  proposal  would
repeal  a  recent  ordinance  passed
by the City's  governing body that
imposes  a  fee  of five  percent  of
the wholesale purchase price, plus
freight,  on  certain  malt  beverage
purchases  in  the  City  effective
July 1, 2015.

The  ordinance  specifies  that  the
malt  beverages subject  to the  fee
be  purchased  from  the  City,  or,
alternatively, that the  fee  be paid
according  to  monthly  statements
received  from the  City  based  on
wholesalers' invoices.

The  ordinance  contains  enforce-
ment  procedures  available  to  the
City  for  noncompliant  license
holders,  and  restricts  the  City's
use of the  collected  fees to retire
the  general  obligation  bonds
issued  for  Prentis  Park  improve-
ments and/or maintenance, opera-
tion,  expansion  or  improvements
to  parks  or  park  facilities  in  the
City.

The  ordinance  provides  for  a
yearly  regular  meeting  agenda
item of the City's governing body
to  update  the  community  on  use
of past and future funds collected,
to gather input regarding continu-
ation  of  the  fee,  and  for  mailed
notice  of  the  agenda  item  to
license holders.

Yes A  vote  “Yes”  will
repeal  the  malt  beverage  fee
ordinance.

No A  vote  “No”  will
retain  the  malt  beverage  fee
ordinance.

Referred Measure

Title:  An  ordinance  amending
Title  XI  ,  adding  Chapter
121,  Day  Care,  to  the  2008
Revised  Ordinances  of  the  City
of  Vermillion,  South  Dakota,
creating  a  requirement  for  day
care  businesses  to  register  with
the  City  of  Vermillion  and
provide  for  certain  health  and
safety requirements. 

City  Attorney's  Explanation:  The
City  of Vermillion  was presented
with  a  municipal  referendum
petition  asking  the  above
ordinance as passed by the City's
governing  body  be  submitted
to  the  voters  for  adoption  or
rejection.

The  referred  ordinance  would
require  day  care  businesses  in
the  City  providing  regular
care  and  supervision  for  five  or
more  children  as  parental  care
supplement,  with  or  without
compensation, to register with the
City  of  Vermillion  every  two
years. 

The  ordinance  requires  age
minimums for day care  providers
and  workers,  cardiopulmonary
resuscitation  (CPR)  certification
for day care operators, sex offense
registrant  disqualification  from
day  care  employment  or
residence, and City inspections of
day  care  premises  to  determine
building  and  fire  code  compli-
ance.  The  ordinance  also  makes
fence,  hedge,  trellis  or  other
barrier  enclosures  necessary  for
playground  areas,  unless  parents
or guardians of each child consent
to  lack  of  such  enclosures  at
specific premises. 

Day  care  businesses  registered
with  the  state  would  not  be
subject  to  City  inspections,  but
would  still  need  to  register  with
the  City.  A  registration  fee  may
be set by  resolution  of the  City's
governing body, but to date a fee
has not been established.

Yes A  vote  “Yes”  will
adopt  the  day  care  registration
ordinance.

No A vote  “No”  will  not
adopt  day  the  care  registration
ordinance.

The polling place in each ward of
this municipality is as follows:

National  Guard  Armory/
Community Center 603 Princeton
Street

Voters  with  disabilities  may
contact  the  finance  officer  for
information and special assistance
in  absentee  voting  or  polling
place accessibility

The entire Initiated Measure  is as
follows:

Be  it  ordained  that  title  XI
Business  Regulations,  Chapter
112  Alcoholic  Beverages  of  the
Revised  Ordinances  of  the  City
of  Vermillion,  South  Dakota
sections  112.24  through  112.31
imposing  a  charge  upon  malt
beverages  purchases  pursuant  to
SDCL  35-4-60.2  are  hereby
repealed.

The  entire  Referred  Measure  is
ordinance number 1326 that is as
follows:

ORDINANCE NUMBER 1326
AN  ORDINANCE  AMENDING
TITLE  XI,  ADDING CHAPTER
121,  DAY CARE, TO THE 2008
REVISED  ORDINANCES  OF
THE  CITY  OF  VERMILLION,
SOUTH  DAKOTA,  CREATING
A  REQUIREMENT  FOR  DAY-
CARE BUSINESSES TO REGIS-
TER WITH THE CITY OF VER-
MILLION  AND  PROVIDING
FOR  CERTAIN  HEALTH  AND
SAFETY REQUIREMENTS. 

WHEREAS,  the  governing  body
of  the  City  of  Vermillion  has
deemed  these  regulations  and
controls  to  be  reasonable  and
related  to  the  purpose of promot-
ing the health, safety, and general
welfare of the City of Vermillion.

NOW,  THEREFORE,  BE  IT
ORDAINED,  by  the  governing
body  of  the  City  of  Vermillion,
South  Dakota,  that  there  be
enacted  a  requirement  for  all
day  care  businesses  within  the
corporate  limits  of  Vermillion  to
be  registered  with  the  City  of
Vermillion and Chapter 121 shall
be added to Title XI as follows:

121.01 Definitions. The following
words,  terms  and  phrases,  when
used in this article, shall have the
meanings provided in this section,
except  where  the  context  clearly
indicates a different meaning:
“Home  day  care”  means  the
providing  of  group  care  and
supervision  of  five  or  more
children on a regular basis for part
of a day, with or without compen-
sation, as a supplement to regular
parental  care,  including  children
under the age of six living in the
home  and  children  from  more
than one unrelated  family  receiv-
ing day care. (This definition may
encompass  Day  Care,  Family
and  Day  Care,  Group  activities
defined in the Vermillion  Zoning
Regulations, Chapter 155.)
“Home day care home” means the
private  residence  wherein  day
care is provided.
“Provider”  means  the  principal
caretaker  of children  in  a  family
day care home. 

121.02  Required.  Every  person
engaged  in  the  business  of
operating  a  home day care  shall,
before engaging in such business,
register with  the  City  of  Vermil-
lion  as  provided  in  this  article.
The fee for such registration shall
be set by resolution.

121.03  Application.  Any  person
desiring  to  register  as  provided
in  this  article  shall  file  with  the
City  Finance  Officer  a  written
application  on  a  form  provided
by the City. The application shall
be  signed  by  each  adult  at  least
18  years  of  age  operating  the
day  care.  The  application  shall
contain,  at  a  minimum,  the
following information:

1.  A  floor  plan  of  the
proposed location;

2.   The expected number and
age  range  of  the  children  being
cared for.
Registration  to  engage  in  the
business  of  home  day  care
operation  shall  be  valid  until  the
next June 30 in an even numbered
year.  Applications  for  renewal
shall be submitted within 45 days
of  the  expiration  of  the  current
registration.

121.04  Central  registry  for  child
abuse  and  neglect/sex  offender
registry. No person whose name is
currently,  or  at  any  time  in  the
past has been on the state  central
registry for abuse and neglect, the
state sex offender registry, or any
similar registry or list  maintained
by  any  other  state,  shall  reside
in  the  premises  in  which  the
home  day care  business  is  being
conducted,  nor  shall  such  person
be  employed  in  any  capacity  by
the  home  day  care.  Applicant
shall  provide  an  affidavit  to  this
extent. 

121.05  Age  requirements.  No
person under 18 years of age may
be  registered  under  this  article.
No  person  between  14  years
of age  and 17 years  of age may
provide  child  care  services  in  a
home day care unless a registered
home  day  care  provider  is
actually  present  in the  home  day
care facility.

121.06  CPR  required.  All  home
day  care  operators  registered
under this article must maintain a
current  cardiopulmonary  resusci-
tation  (CPR)  certification  from
the American Red Cross or Amer-
ican  Heart  Association.  Employ-
ees of a home day care are recom-
mended to have such certification.

121.07 Inspections. Any day care
licensed under this article shall be
inspected  by  the  Fire  Chief,  or
designee,  prior  to  registration
approval.  All  home  daycares
shall  be  open  to  announced  or
unannounced  inspection  by  city
officials  at  any  time  during
normal  business  hours.  The  Fire
Chief or designee shall  re-inspect
each premise prior to recommend-
ing the renewal of registration.
Exception:  All  home  day
cares  registered  by  July  1,  2015
will  not  be  required  to  complete
an  inspection  for  the  initial
registration.

121.08  Fencing  or  other  barrier.
Playground  areas  shall  be
enclosed by a fence, hedge, trellis,
or  other  barrier not  less  than  42
inches  high  to  protect  the  area
from  traffic,  animals,  or  other
hazards.  Openings  in  a  fence,
trellis,  or  other  manmade  barrier
shall  not  allow  passage  of
a  four-inch  diameter  sphere.
Playground  areas  shall  be  in
rear yard whenever possible.  Day
care  center  fence  requirements
contained  in  Vermillion  Zoning
Regulations,  Chapter  155,  will
prevail  to  the  extent  they  apply
and conflict with this provision.
Exception:  A  registered  daycare
provider may be exempt from the
fencing  or  other  barrier  require-
ment  of  this  section  if  a  written
consent  form signed  by a  parent
or  guardian  of  each  child  being
cared for  stating  they understand
that  there  is  not  an  enclosed
playground  area at  the  registered
location. 

121.09  Building  code  require-
ments  applicable.  Nothing  in
this  article  shall  be  construed  to
exempt  any  structure  from  any
otherwise  applicable  portion  of
the  relevant  building  code  or
fire  code.  In  any  case  where  the
building code requirements are in
conflict  with  the  requirements  of
this  article,  the  more  stringent
requirement shall apply. 

121.11 State registered home day
cares. Any home day care  which
falls  within  the  scope  of  this
article but which is registered as a
family day care pursuant to SDCL
ch. 26-6 and ARSD ch. 67:42:03
shall  be  required  to  register
pursuant to this article. 

121.12  All  home  day  care
facilities  shall  comply  with  the
most recent version of the Interna-
tional Fire Code and International
Building  Code  as  modified  and
adopted by the City.

Adopted  the  6th  day  of  April,
2015.

_________________________
Michael  D.  Carlson,  Finance
Officer

Published  twice  at  the  total
approximate cost of $239.51.
Publish: June 19 & 26, 2015.

NOTICE OF SPECIAL
ELECTION

MUNICIPALITY OF
VERMILLION

A Special Election will be held on
June  30,  2015,  in  Vermillion,
South Dakota.  If the polls  cannot
be  opened  because  of  bad
weather,  the  election  may  be
postponed one week.

The  election  polls  will  be  open
from  seven  a.m.  to  seven  p.m.
central  standard  time  on  the  day
of the election.

At  the  election,  the  following
questions will be voted upon:

Initiated Measure

Title:  The  repeal  of  Title  XI,
Business  Regulations,  Chapter
112  Alcoholic  Beverages,
Sections  112.24  through  112.31
of  the  2008  Revised  Ordinances
of the  City  of Vermillion,  South
Dakota,  imposing  a  charge  upon
malt beverage purchases pursuant
to SDCL 35-4-60.2.

City  Attorney's  Explanation:  The
City  of Vermillion  was presented
with  a  municipal  initiative
petition asking the above proposal
be  submitted  to  the  voters  for
adoption or rejection.

The  initiated  proposal  would
repeal  a  recent  ordinance  passed
by the City's  governing body that
imposes  a  fee  of five  percent  of
the wholesale purchase price, plus
freight,  on  certain  malt  beverage
purchases  in  the  City  effective
July 1, 2015.

The  ordinance  specifies  that  the
malt  beverages subject  to the  fee
be  purchased  from  the  City,  or,
alternatively, that the  fee  be paid
according  to  monthly  statements
received  from the  City  based  on
wholesalers' invoices.

The  ordinance  contains  enforce-
ment  procedures  available  to  the
City  for  noncompliant  license
holders,  and  restricts  the  City's
use of the  collected  fees to retire
the  general  obligation  bonds
issued  for  Prentis  Park  improve-
ments and/or maintenance, opera-
tion,  expansion  or  improvements
to  parks  or  park  facilities  in  the
City.

The  ordinance  provides  for  a
yearly  regular  meeting  agenda
item of the City's governing body
to  update  the  community  on  use
of past and future funds collected,
to gather input regarding continu-
ation  of  the  fee,  and  for  mailed
notice  of  the  agenda  item  to
license holders.

Yes A  vote  “Yes”  will
repeal  the  malt  beverage  fee
ordinance.

No A  vote  “No”  will
retain  the  malt  beverage  fee
ordinance.

Referred Measure

Title:  An  ordinance  amending
Title  XI  ,  adding  Chapter
121,  Day  Care,  to  the  2008
Revised  Ordinances  of  the  City
of  Vermillion,  South  Dakota,
creating  a  requirement  for  day
care  businesses  to  register  with
the  City  of  Vermillion  and
provide  for  certain  health  and
safety requirements. 

City  Attorney's  Explanation:  The
City  of Vermillion  was presented
with  a  municipal  referendum
petition  asking  the  above
ordinance as passed by the City's
governing  body  be  submitted
to  the  voters  for  adoption  or
rejection.

The  referred  ordinance  would
require  day  care  businesses  in
the  City  providing  regular
care  and  supervision  for  five  or
more  children  as  parental  care
supplement,  with  or  without
compensation, to register with the
City  of  Vermillion  every  two
years. 

The  ordinance  requires  age
minimums for day care  providers
and  workers,  cardiopulmonary
resuscitation  (CPR)  certification
for day care operators, sex offense
registrant  disqualification  from
day  care  employment  or
residence, and City inspections of
day  care  premises  to  determine
building  and  fire  code  compli-
ance.  The  ordinance  also  makes
fence,  hedge,  trellis  or  other
barrier  enclosures  necessary  for
playground  areas,  unless  parents
or guardians of each child consent
to  lack  of  such  enclosures  at
specific premises. 

Day  care  businesses  registered
with  the  state  would  not  be
subject  to  City  inspections,  but
would  still  need  to  register  with
the  City.  A  registration  fee  may
be set by  resolution  of the  City's
governing body, but to date a fee
has not been established.

Yes A  vote  “Yes”  will
adopt  the  day  care  registration
ordinance.

No A vote  “No”  will  not
adopt  day  the  care  registration
ordinance.

The polling place in each ward of
this municipality is as follows:

National  Guard  Armory/
Community Center 603 Princeton
Street

Voters  with  disabilities  may
contact  the  finance  officer  for
information and special assistance
in  absentee  voting  or  polling
place accessibility

The entire Initiated Measure  is as
follows:

Be  it  ordained  that  title  XI
Business  Regulations,  Chapter
112  Alcoholic  Beverages  of  the
Revised  Ordinances  of  the  City
of  Vermillion,  South  Dakota
sections  112.24  through  112.31
imposing  a  charge  upon  malt
beverages  purchases  pursuant  to
SDCL  35-4-60.2  are  hereby
repealed.

The  entire  Referred  Measure  is
ordinance number 1326 that is as
follows:

ORDINANCE NUMBER 1326
AN  ORDINANCE  AMENDING
TITLE  XI,  ADDING CHAPTER
121,  DAY CARE, TO THE 2008
REVISED  ORDINANCES  OF
THE  CITY  OF  VERMILLION,
SOUTH  DAKOTA,  CREATING
A  REQUIREMENT  FOR  DAY-
CARE BUSINESSES TO REGIS-
TER WITH THE CITY OF VER-
MILLION  AND  PROVIDING
FOR  CERTAIN  HEALTH  AND
SAFETY REQUIREMENTS. 

WHEREAS,  the  governing  body
of  the  City  of  Vermillion  has
deemed  these  regulations  and
controls  to  be  reasonable  and
related  to  the  purpose of promot-
ing the health, safety, and general
welfare of the City of Vermillion.

NOW,  THEREFORE,  BE  IT
ORDAINED,  by  the  governing
body  of  the  City  of  Vermillion,
South  Dakota,  that  there  be
enacted  a  requirement  for  all
day  care  businesses  within  the
corporate  limits  of  Vermillion  to
be  registered  with  the  City  of
Vermillion and Chapter 121 shall
be added to Title XI as follows:

121.01 Definitions. The following
words,  terms  and  phrases,  when
used in this article, shall have the
meanings provided in this section,
except  where  the  context  clearly
indicates a different meaning:
“Home  day  care”  means  the
providing  of  group  care  and
supervision  of  five  or  more
children on a regular basis for part
of a day, with or without compen-
sation, as a supplement to regular
parental  care,  including  children
under the age of six living in the
home  and  children  from  more
than one unrelated  family  receiv-
ing day care. (This definition may
encompass  Day  Care,  Family
and  Day  Care,  Group  activities
defined in the Vermillion  Zoning
Regulations, Chapter 155.)
“Home day care home” means the
private  residence  wherein  day
care is provided.
“Provider”  means  the  principal
caretaker  of children  in  a  family
day care home. 

121.02  Required.  Every  person
engaged  in  the  business  of
operating  a  home day care  shall,
before engaging in such business,
register with  the  City  of  Vermil-
lion  as  provided  in  this  article.
The fee for such registration shall
be set by resolution.

121.03  Application.  Any  person
desiring  to  register  as  provided
in  this  article  shall  file  with  the
City  Finance  Officer  a  written
application  on  a  form  provided
by the City. The application shall
be  signed  by  each  adult  at  least
18  years  of  age  operating  the
day  care.  The  application  shall
contain,  at  a  minimum,  the
following information:

1.  A  floor  plan  of  the
proposed location;

2.   The expected number and
age  range  of  the  children  being
cared for.
Registration  to  engage  in  the
business  of  home  day  care
operation  shall  be  valid  until  the
next June 30 in an even numbered
year.  Applications  for  renewal
shall be submitted within 45 days
of  the  expiration  of  the  current
registration.

121.04  Central  registry  for  child
abuse  and  neglect/sex  offender
registry. No person whose name is
currently,  or  at  any  time  in  the
past has been on the state  central
registry for abuse and neglect, the
state sex offender registry, or any
similar registry or list  maintained
by  any  other  state,  shall  reside
in  the  premises  in  which  the
home  day care  business  is  being
conducted,  nor  shall  such  person
be  employed  in  any  capacity  by
the  home  day  care.  Applicant
shall  provide  an  affidavit  to  this
extent. 

121.05  Age  requirements.  No
person under 18 years of age may
be  registered  under  this  article.
No  person  between  14  years
of age  and 17 years  of age may
provide  child  care  services  in  a
home day care unless a registered
home  day  care  provider  is
actually  present  in the  home  day
care facility.

121.06  CPR  required.  All  home
day  care  operators  registered
under this article must maintain a
current  cardiopulmonary  resusci-
tation  (CPR)  certification  from
the American Red Cross or Amer-
ican  Heart  Association.  Employ-
ees of a home day care are recom-
mended to have such certification.

121.07 Inspections. Any day care
licensed under this article shall be
inspected  by  the  Fire  Chief,  or
designee,  prior  to  registration
approval.  All  home  daycares
shall  be  open  to  announced  or
unannounced  inspection  by  city
officials  at  any  time  during
normal  business  hours.  The  Fire
Chief or designee shall  re-inspect
each premise prior to recommend-
ing the renewal of registration.
Exception:  All  home  day
cares  registered  by  July  1,  2015
will  not  be  required  to  complete
an  inspection  for  the  initial
registration.

121.08  Fencing  or  other  barrier.
Playground  areas  shall  be
enclosed by a fence, hedge, trellis,
or  other  barrier not  less  than  42
inches  high  to  protect  the  area
from  traffic,  animals,  or  other
hazards.  Openings  in  a  fence,
trellis,  or  other  manmade  barrier
shall  not  allow  passage  of
a  four-inch  diameter  sphere.
Playground  areas  shall  be  in
rear yard whenever possible.  Day
care  center  fence  requirements
contained  in  Vermillion  Zoning
Regulations,  Chapter  155,  will
prevail  to  the  extent  they  apply
and conflict with this provision.
Exception:  A  registered  daycare
provider may be exempt from the
fencing  or  other  barrier  require-
ment  of  this  section  if  a  written
consent  form signed  by a  parent
or  guardian  of  each  child  being
cared for  stating  they understand
that  there  is  not  an  enclosed
playground  area at  the  registered
location. 

121.09  Building  code  require-
ments  applicable.  Nothing  in
this  article  shall  be  construed  to
exempt  any  structure  from  any
otherwise  applicable  portion  of
the  relevant  building  code  or
fire  code.  In  any  case  where  the
building code requirements are in
conflict  with  the  requirements  of
this  article,  the  more  stringent
requirement shall apply. 

121.11 State registered home day
cares. Any home day care  which
falls  within  the  scope  of  this
article but which is registered as a
family day care pursuant to SDCL
ch. 26-6 and ARSD ch. 67:42:03
shall  be  required  to  register
pursuant to this article. 

121.12  All  home  day  care
facilities  shall  comply  with  the
most recent version of the Interna-
tional Fire Code and International
Building  Code  as  modified  and
adopted by the City.

Adopted  the  6th  day  of  April,
2015.

_________________________
Michael  D.  Carlson,  Finance
Officer

Published  twice  at  the  total
approximate cost of $239.51.
Publish: June 19 & 26, 2015.

For Sale: 16 month old Angus
bulls  from  Rito  blood  lines,
some can be used on heifers.
Call  Allen  Bierema  605-661-
5624.  

FREE  for  30  words  or  less
for  private  party classified
line  ads  in  the  Broadcaster
and  Plain  Talk.  If  you  need
more  than  30  words,  don't
worry you still  won't  pay a lot.
A 31-word ad is only $.90 and
the cost only goes up $.50 per
word thereafter. Stop in at 201
W. Cherry Street, Vermillion or
call 605-624-4429.

1830 Rummage Sales

1850 Agriculture

1870 Ag Equipment

1875 Livestock - Poultry

2000 Notices

2000 Notices

2010 Legal and Public 
Notices

2010 Legal and Public 
Notices

2010 Legal and Public 
Notices

2010 Legal and Public 
Notices

2010 Legal and Public 
Notices

Several  crews  of bean
walkers  –  any  type  of  farm
work,  including  cutting  cedar
trees, pick up rocks and sticks.
For  more  information  call
712-943-2084.

822 North Crawford Road
Friday, 6/26, 8am-5pm

Saturday, 6/27, 8am-12pm
Sofa,  chairs,  entertainment
center, end table, clothing, bed
spreads:  queen  and  king,
curtains  and  lots  of  misc.
items.

Polled Hereford bulls for sale.
Two-year-olds  and  yearling's.
Bulls are ready to go to work in
your  pasture!   Good selection
available.  Mettler Polled Here-
fors,   Brian  and  Ron  Mettler,
Menno,  SD.  605-951-3007 or
605-387-2841.  

JD MFWD 7230 Premium, only
3,000 hours, 2008 model, real-
ly  nice,  PRICE  REDUCED.
402-640-1306
www.HobbyFarmTractors.com

Polled  Yearling  Charolais
bulls.  Bloodlines of Milestone,
fore  front,  asset.   No  creep
feed,  good-disposition  reason-
ably priced.  All Sires are 4+ lb
gainers.  605-387-5366 or 605-
951-4728.

Registered  Yearling  and 2
year  old  Angus  Bulls.   Many
are suitable for heifers.  Also, 2
Sim  Angus  bulls  all  are  from
AI.  Marnie Schieffer 402-388-
4532  or  John  Schieffer  605-
661-8531.

30367 HWY 19 - ACROSS
FROM CLAY RURAL WATER
SATURDAY, 6/27, 8AM-4PM

HUGE  MOVING  SALE.
FOR  THE  GALS:  Sofa,  sofa
bed, dark cherry armoire, office
desk,  Dept.  56 pieces,  Christ-
mas  items,  many  craft  items
&  materials,  Noritake  china,
etched  crystal  glasses,  misc.
glassware,  picture  frames,
lamps,  bedding,  small  chest
of  drawers,  coats,  and  many
misc. items. 
FOR THE GUYS: 9” band saw,
power miter, 220V MIG welder
w/cart  &  tank,  14”  chop  saw,
small  microwave,  pneumatic
tools,  small  towable spreader,
weed  burner,  pole  saw,  gas
weed  trimmer,  paint  sprayers,
pipe  wrenches,  pvc  fittings,
misc.  hardware,  and  much
more!

AUCTIONS

REAL  ESTATE  AUCTION,
4.09  acres  w/house,  shop,
storage  buildings.  Located  4
1/2 miles from South Whitlock,
Missouri  River,  Gettysburg,
SD, July 11, for more informa-
tion www.penrodauctions.com.

EMPLOYMENT

GREAT  PAYING  JOBS!
Statewide  construction  jobs,
$15.00 - $22.00 hourly + bene-
fits. Summer or permanent. No
experience  necessary,  great
career  opportunities.  Apply
Online www.sdwork.org.

DIRECTOR  OF  NURSING:
position  available  at  the
Strasburg Care Center, located
in South Central ND. Qualifica-
tions  desired  are  a  valid  ND
RN license with BSN preferred,
long term care experience, and
managerial  experience.  SCC
offers  a  full  benefit  package
with  a  competitive  wage.  If
interested in joining our 5 Star
Facility  team  please  contact
Brian Schumacher at 701-336-
2651  or  409  S  3rd  Street-
Strasburg, ND 58573.

LIQUOR    STORE/BAR   
MANAGER position  available
in  Kadoka,  SD.  Please  return
letter of interest, resume and/or
application  to  City  Finance
Office,  Box  58,  Kadoka,  SD
57543.  Salary  DOQ,  plus
benefits. Applications accepted
until 4:00 pm July 10, 2015. 

FULL  TIME  ASSISTANT
farm/ranch  manger  position
available  in  Presho,  SD.
All  inquires  confidential,  top
pay  for  qualified  applicants.
Contact Dustin Smith 605-280-
4641.

GREAT  PAYING  JOBS!
Statewide  construction  jobs,
$15.00 - $22.00 hourly + bene-
fits. Summer or permanent. No
experience  necessary,  great
career  opportunities.  Apply
Online www.sdwork.org.

HEALTHCARE  JOBS  NOW
HIRING:  RNs,  LPNs/LVNs,
CNAs,  Med  Aides.  $2,000
Bonus - Free Gas. Call AACO
@ 1-800-656-4414 Ext. 5

RAILROAD  VEGETATION
CONTROL:  Full-time  traveling
opportunity, 60-80 hours/week,
$11-$15/hour, meal allowance,
paid  lodging  &  benefit  pack-
age.  RAW,  Inc.  in  Cooper-
stown,  ND  -  888-700-0292
www.rawapplicators.com 
info@rawapplicators.com.

GREAT  PAYING  JOBS!
Statewide  construction  jobs,
$15.00 - $22.00 hourly + bene-
fits. Summer or permanent. No
experience  necessary,  great
career  opportunities.  Apply
Online www.sdwork.org.

FT  SPECIAL  EDUCATION
TEACHER  for  BH  Children's
Home.  Regular  school  hours,
M-F,  *  Year  round  school*
Salary  +  benefits.  For  details
&  application  visit  us  -
www.chssd.org.

FOR SALE

RESTAURANT  EQUIPMENT
OUTLET;  New  &  Used
Restaurant  Equipment  see
www.Chillmasters.biz,  call
1-800-526-7105,  or  stop  by
Showroom  to  see  what's  in
stock for you! Sioux City, IA.

STEEL  BUILDINGS  -  Must
sell now! 1 - 50 x 80, 1 - 60 x
125, 1 - 68 x 203, 1 - 80 x 225.
Save  thousands!  Call  now
1-800-931-7858. 

MISCELLANEOUS

CEMETARY  RESTORATION
WORK.  Straighten  monu-
ments,  replace  foundations,
tree  trimming,  tree  removal.
Specializing in cemetery work.
Insured.  Contact  Dan  at
Dakota Memorials & Cemetery
Services. Great prices on new
monuments.  Large  selection
available. 605-692-2445.

SEARCH  STATE-WIDE
APARTMENT listings,  sorted
by rent, location and other op-
tions.  www.sdhousingsearch.-
com  South  Dakota  Housing
Development  Authority  -  An
Equal Housing Opportunity.

NOTICES

ADVERTISE  IN  NEWSPA-
PERS statewide  for  only
$150.00. Put the South Dakota
Statewide Classifieds  Network
to  work  for  you  today!
(25  words  for  $150.  Each
additional  word  $5.)  Call  this
newspaper  or  800-658-3697
for details.

AUCTIONS

REAL  ESTATE  AUCTION,
4.09  acres  w/house,  shop,
storage  buildings.  Located  4
1/2 miles from South Whitlock,
Missouri  River,  Gettysburg,
SD, July 11, for more informa-
tion www.penrodauctions.com.

EMPLOYMENT

GREAT  PAYING  JOBS!
Statewide  construction  jobs,
$15.00 - $22.00 hourly + bene-
fits. Summer or permanent. No
experience  necessary,  great
career  opportunities.  Apply
Online www.sdwork.org.

DIRECTOR  OF  NURSING:
position  available  at  the
Strasburg Care Center, located
in South Central ND. Qualifica-
tions  desired  are  a  valid  ND
RN license with BSN preferred,
long term care experience, and
managerial  experience.  SCC
offers  a  full  benefit  package
with  a  competitive  wage.  If
interested in joining our 5 Star
Facility  team  please  contact
Brian Schumacher at 701-336-
2651  or  409  S  3rd  Street-
Strasburg, ND 58573.

LIQUOR    STORE/BAR   
MANAGER position  available
in  Kadoka,  SD.  Please  return
letter of interest, resume and/or
application  to  City  Finance
Office,  Box  58,  Kadoka,  SD
57543.  Salary  DOQ,  plus
benefits. Applications accepted
until 4:00 pm July 10, 2015. 

FULL  TIME  ASSISTANT
farm/ranch  manger  position
available  in  Presho,  SD.
All  inquires  confidential,  top
pay  for  qualified  applicants.
Contact Dustin Smith 605-280-
4641.

GREAT  PAYING  JOBS!
Statewide  construction  jobs,
$15.00 - $22.00 hourly + bene-
fits. Summer or permanent. No
experience  necessary,  great
career  opportunities.  Apply
Online www.sdwork.org.

HEALTHCARE  JOBS  NOW
HIRING:  RNs,  LPNs/LVNs,
CNAs,  Med  Aides.  $2,000
Bonus - Free Gas. Call AACO
@ 1-800-656-4414 Ext. 5

RAILROAD  VEGETATION
CONTROL:  Full-time  traveling
opportunity, 60-80 hours/week,
$11-$15/hour, meal allowance,
paid  lodging  &  benefit  pack-
age.  RAW,  Inc.  in  Cooper-
stown,  ND  -  888-700-0292
www.rawapplicators.com 
info@rawapplicators.com.

GREAT  PAYING  JOBS!
Statewide  construction  jobs,
$15.00 - $22.00 hourly + bene-
fits. Summer or permanent. No
experience  necessary,  great
career  opportunities.  Apply
Online www.sdwork.org.

FT  SPECIAL  EDUCATION
TEACHER  for  BH  Children's
Home.  Regular  school  hours,
M-F,  *  Year  round  school*
Salary  +  benefits.  For  details
&  application  visit  us  -
www.chssd.org.

FOR SALE

RESTAURANT  EQUIPMENT
OUTLET;  New  &  Used
Restaurant  Equipment  see
www.Chillmasters.biz,  call
1-800-526-7105,  or  stop  by
Showroom  to  see  what's  in
stock for you! Sioux City, IA.

STEEL  BUILDINGS  -  Must
sell now! 1 - 50 x 80, 1 - 60 x
125, 1 - 68 x 203, 1 - 80 x 225.
Save  thousands!  Call  now
1-800-931-7858. 

MISCELLANEOUS

CEMETARY  RESTORATION
WORK.  Straighten  monu-
ments,  replace  foundations,
tree  trimming,  tree  removal.
Specializing in cemetery work.
Insured.  Contact  Dan  at
Dakota Memorials & Cemetery
Services. Great prices on new
monuments.  Large  selection
available. 605-692-2445.

SEARCH  STATE-WIDE
APARTMENT listings,  sorted
by rent, location and other op-
tions.  www.sdhousingsearch.-
com  South  Dakota  Housing
Development  Authority  -  An
Equal Housing Opportunity.

NOTICES

ADVERTISE  IN  NEWSPA-
PERS statewide  for  only
$150.00. Put the South Dakota
Statewide Classifieds  Network
to  work  for  you  today!
(25  words  for  $150.  Each
additional  word  $5.)  Call  this
newspaper  or  800-658-3697
for details.

Vermillion Plain Talk  11June 26, 2015 www.plaintalk.net

CLASSIFIEDA2


