
Broadcaster Press  07March 13, 2012 www.broadcasteronline.com

 The shu ttle w ill leave Little Italy’s in  Verm illion  a t 6:20pm . Parkin g n ear restau ra n t.

  “Put on Your Green”
 For the

 VAAC’s St. Patrick’s Day Celebration
 Saturday, March 17, 2012, 6-9p.m.

 Washington Street Arts Center, 
 202 Washington St., Vermillion

 Com e savor our Irish beef stew  an d potato soup, soda bread, desserts, an d a 
 variety of Irish brew s, w in e, soda an d other beverages. Tickets at the door. 
 Adult m em bers $8; n on -m em bers $12. $5 for children  ages 11-18, free for 

 children  10 &  u n der. Prize draw in gs for n ew  an d current m em bers!

 Spon sored by   Verm illion  Area Arts Cou n cil, Carey’s Bar, Jon es Foods, H y-Vee &  W al-M art

 Irish Folk M usic by Good People w ith Chris H oover, 
 Grace Freem an ’s Irish Dan cers, an d Photographs by M ary Black Bon n et .

 “The Land 
 And 

 Its People”
  Preservation   /   Conservation 

 
 

Easements

 Wednesday, March 21st, 7pm
 Vermillion Public Library

 FREE to the Public

 Speakers:
 Liz Almlie : State Preservation Office

 John Davidson:    Northern Prairies 
 

 
Land Trust

 Sponsored by 
 

 
Clay County Historic Preservation 

 
 

Commission

 Vintage Quilt Show
 Austin-Whittemore House

 15 Austin Street., Vermillion, SD
 March 23 & 24, 1-4pm Daily

 Save the Date!

 $5 donation requested

By Cleo Erickson
Excerpts from the Plain Talk

1972
Several people have

suggested that autos are
being driven too fast a
pace through the city.  It
would probably be as
well to go slower before
someone is hurt as
afterward.

Chester H. Johnson
of Beresford succeeds
John Scott in the Coyote
Barber Shop.  He is a
steady workman and
will hold his own with
other Vermillion
barbers.

Someone has
expressed an intention
of starting a green house
in Vermilion and
another man asked
about the prospects of
establishing a seed
separating factory at this
point.

In June of 1972,
Oscar Howe, Professor
of Art and Artist in
Residence at USD, was
awarded an honorary
Doctor of Letters degree
by Dakota Wesleyan
University at Mitchell.
For many years Dr.
Howe has designed the
corn mosaics at the
Mitchell Corn Palace.

Minority groups in
Clay County total 164.

Of that number 118 are
16 years of age and
older.

In 1875 the paper
reported that the town
has improved by the
removal of a massive
manure pile from
Chestnut Street, near
Michigan Avenue.  Also
reported was a fall taken
by Mrs. H. J. Austin
when she fell out of her
buggy. She only received
a light injury.

The 2nd Vermillion
Municipal Band
Concert will be held at
Prentis Park on July 12,
1972.  The public is
invited to spend a
summer evening in the
park.

The Paint Brush
Corporation is a new
business in town.  The
company has moved to
Vermillion after 26 years
of operation in Melrose
Park, Ill.  There are still
a few last minute odds
and ends that need to be
taken care of before they
are open for business.

Parents are being
asked to buy locks for
their children’s bikes.
The police department
says there are numerous
calls every day because
of stolen bikes.  A
simple lock for the bike
could prevent a lot of

trouble for the police
and a lot of frustration
for your children.

Over 700 pounds of
ribs were prepared by
pros: Larry Mart and
Tom Chaney for the
Jaycees River Day
barbeque on Sunday,
July 30, 1972.

Like a falling star, the
USD observatory fell
last week.  For 33 years,
the observatory dome
provided all night
shelter for student star
gazers.  The telescope
had a “weight clock”
making it possible to
correlate its movement
with the rotation of the
earth.

A local resident
reported to the Police
that she saw someone
taking three trash
receptacles from the
light poles in the vicinity
of Main and Prospect
streets. She was able to
give a good description
of those involved and
the license number of
the car.  The party was
apprehended and the
receptacles returned.

The Cub Scouts
started a pop bottle
drive last week with
each pack being
assigned a specific area
of the city to canvas.
The funds netted from
this drive are to be used
for expenses of pack
activities.  Pack 165
collected 1372 bottles.
Pack 321 collected 1346
and Pack 12 had turned
in 740 bottles to date
with more dens left to
report.

The Co-Ed Theatre
that burned down
earlier this year will be
sporting a new name
when it opens in the
near future. Jack March,
owner, said it will be
known as the “Coyote
Theatre”.  The theatre
should be open in about
two weeks but the
management is awaiting
the arrival of the new
seats.

According to Carl
Rauk, it is 100 years ago
on December 2, 1972
since the first train
arrived in Vermillion.
The construction of the
Dakota Southern began
in Sioux City in August
of 1872 and reached
Vermillion in December
of the same year.  The
line was finished to
Yankton in January of
1873.

In 1880 the
Milwaukee Railroad
purchased the Dakota
Southern and extended
the line from Yankton to
Scotland in 1882 and
from Scotland to
Mitchell in 1886.  The
first depot in Vermillion
was built in 1872 and
the first agent was
George Kolb.  The
second depot was built
in 1924 and is now
vacated.  Hundreds of
people turned out for
the dedication of the
second depot in 1924,

END 1972

SESQUICENTENNIAL HIGHLIGHTS

 Major Gift Officers

 The University of South Dakota Foundation is seeking two 
 experienced development officers to raise major gifts for 
 the University.  One would be for the Athletic Program and 
 one for the Schools of Business and Education and the 
 College of Fine Arts.

 The University of South Dakota is the state’s flagship liberal 
 arts university with a medical school as well as a law school 
 and is in the final stage of its transition to NCAA Division I 
 Athletics. 

 Qualifications include a bachelor’s degree and three years 
 experience in fundraising, preferably in higher education. 
 Related experience will be considered in lieu of fund-
 raising.  Excellent interpersonal skills, communications skills 
 (both oral and written), a high energy level, and extensive 
 travel are required. Self-starters who are familiar with South 
 Dakota and the upper Midwest are desirable. Both 
 positions will report to the Foundation’s Vice President for 
 Development and the Athletic position will coordinate 
 with the Senior Associate Athletics Director and work 
 closely with other members of both the development and 
 athletic staffs.

 Applicants should submit a résumé and at least three 
 professional references to Kathleen Chandler, Director of 
 Administration, USD Foundation, P.O. Box 5555, Vermillion, SD 
 57069 or by email Kathleen.Chandler@USDFoundation.org. 
 Review of applications will begin immediately and continue 
 until the positions are filled. Title and salary are commensurate 
 with experience.  The USD Foundation is an equal opportunity 
 employer.

 Additional information:  www.usdfoundation.org;
 Telephone 1-800-521-3575


